Chair PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
Tom McGann MAY 9, 2017 AT 6:45 PM

Commissioners CORDOVA CENTER COMMUNITY ROOMS A & B
Scott Pegau

J(fl?n B:fr?en

Allen Roembhildt M

Mark Frohnapfel

Heath Kocan

Nancy Bird 1. CALL TO ORDER

City Planner 2. ROLL CALL

Samantha Greenwood Chair Tom McGann, Commissioners Scott Pegau, John Baenen, Allen
Assistant Planner Roemhildt, Mark Frohnapfel, Heath Kocan, and Nancy Bird
Leif Stavig 3. APPROVAL OF AGENDA (voice vote)

4. APPROVAL OF CONSENT CALENDAR (voice vote)
a. Minutes of April 11, 2017 Regular MEEtING ........ccccuiieiuiiieiieeeieeeiee ettt
b. Record excused absence for Heath Kocan from the April 11, 2017 Regular Meeting
DISCLOSURES OF CONFLICTS OF INTEREST
6. CORRESPONDENCE
a. State of Alaska DOT PUDIIC NOTICE ....ccviiiiiiieeiiieeiiee ettt ee e vee e e e e e e e saaeeenaeeenaeas
b. State of Alaska DOT PUDLiC NOLICE .....ocuviuiiiiriiiiiiieeiietcee ettt s
c. Letter from Bruce and Sally Campbell............cccuiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeee e e e
7. COMMUNICATIONS BY AND PETITIONS FROM VISITORS
a. Guest Speakers
b. Audience comments regarding agenda items (3 minutes per speaker)
PLANNER’S REPORT ......ooiiiiiiiee ettt st ettt e st e sseenseeneenseenseennenns
9. NEW/MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS
a. Variance Request — RJ KOPChaK ........cooiiiiiiiieie e e e
b. Site Plan Review — Ocean Beauty Seafoods Modular Bunkhouses............cccccoevieriiiiiiniieiienieee
c. Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park SubdiviSion...........ccceeeeuieeriiieeriiieeeiie e
10. UNFINISHED BUSINESS
a. Title 16 Building Code DIiSCUSSION .....cc.veiiiuiiieiiieeiiie et e eieeeeite e e eeeeetee s reeesveeessseeessseessaeeessaeesnneeas
11. PENDING CALENDAR
Q. MAY 2017 CaleNAAr .....cc.eiiieiieeeiie ettt et e e e e st e e st a e e e e e e s ab e e e nb e e e aaeeeaaeeeraaeenaeas
D, JUNE 2017 CAlENAAL ...ttt ettt et b et ettt
12. AUDIENCE PARTICIPATION
13. COMMISSION COMMENTS
14. ADJOURNMENT

o

9

If you have a disability that makes it difficult to attend city-sponsored functions, you may contact 424-6200 for assistance.
Full Planning Commission agendas and packets are available online at www.cityofcordova.net.




PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
APRIL 11, 2017 AT 6:30 PM
CORDOVA CENTER COMMUNITY ROOMS A & B
MINUTES

1. CALL TO ORDER

Chair Tom McGann called the Planning Commission Regular Meeting to order at 6:30 PM on April
11,2017 in Cordova Center Community Rooms A & B.

2. ROLL CALL

Present for roll call were Chair Tom McGann and Commissioners Scott Pegau, John Baenen, Allen
Roemhildt, Mark Frohnapfel, and Nancy Bird. Heath Kocan was absent.

Also present was City Planner Samantha Greenwood and Assistant Planner Leif Stavig.
1 person was in the audience.
3. APPROVAL OF AGENDA
M/Pegau S/Bird to approve the agenda.
Upon voice vote, motion passed 6-0.

Yea: McGann, Pegau, Baenen, Roemhildt, Frohnapfel, Bird
Absent: Kocan

4. APPROVAL OF CONSENT CALENDAR

Minutes of March 28,2017 Public Hearing

Minutes of March 28, 2017 Regular Meeting

Record excused absence for Heath Kocan from the March 28, 2017 Regular Meeting
Record unexcused absence for Allen Roemhildt from the March 28, 2017 Regular Meeting

goFpR

M/Bird S/Roemhildt to approve the consent calendar.

Bird made a correction to the minutes of the April 11" Regular Meeting to clarify a statement that
Pegau said regarding the commission’s criteria. There was no objection to the correction.

Bird said that there wasan incorrect statement made at the last meeting and she wondered about putting
a notation in so that people reading the minutes would know. No change was made to the minutes.

Upon voice vote, motion passed 6-0.
Yea: McGann, Pegau, Baenen, Roemhildt, Frohnapfel, Bird
Absent: Kocan

5. DISCLOSURES OF CONFLICTS OF INTEREST
6. CORRESPONDENCE

7. COMMUNICATIONS BY AND PETITIONS FROM VISITORS

Planning Commission Regular Meeting - Minutes
April 11,2017
Page 1 of 3

2 of 96


planner2
DRAFT


a.
b.

PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Guest Speakers
Audience comments regarding agenda items

8. PLANNER’S REPORT

Pegau asked if there was a permit for the work that Ocean Beauty was doing on their existing building.
Greenwood said she would check on it, but she did not think it required a building permit. Stavig said
the thing they tell everyone about commercial and industrial work is to check with the State Fire
Marshall.

Greenwood explained that the Army Corps of Engineers was looking for information about alternative
sites for Shepard Point.

Greenwood said she talked to the State Fire Marshall and any foursplexes will have to go through Fire
and Life Safety Review.

9. NEW/MISCELLANEOUS BUSINESS

a.

IRC Amendments Discussion

McGann said that he concurs with the Planning Department’s comments. He clarified that the
existing amendments for the old code would be going completely away and that only the concept
would become an amendment for the new code: Greenwood said that local amendments were made
to the 1985 Uniform Building Code (UBC) and she wanted to see if there was a reason to keep them.
If they do want to keep the concept of an amendment to the UBC then staff will take the time to find
where it is in the 2012 International Residential Code (IRC) and make a new amendment. Stavig
said that eventually there would be an ordinance repealing the old amendments, so it is important
for them to have somesort of public process reviewing the old code.

Pegau said he thought it was important to maintain a definition for alley. McGann said the question
was if it should be a building code definition. Stavig said it appeared the only reason some of the
definitions were there was to regulate size, which isn’t an ideal way of regulating. Greenwood said
for the definition of grade, the commission should consider whether they are talking about building
or zoning. McGann said for the structure, the height of the building comes into play and the IRC
has a definition that they don’t need to change.

McGann said he thought they should discuss what size structures should be allowed to be
constructed on grade'and what size buildings don’t require a building permit. McGann said he could
see a tool shed being exempt from a building permit, but not a 20°x20’ building. Frohnapfel said
the use of the building should play a part. Greenwood said that only one-story detached accessory
structures that are less than 200 square feet are exempt from a building permit. The commission
concurred with this size building not requiring a permit.

Stavig explained that the frost protection was what required a certain depth for a foundation. Under
the IRC, if he was building a 200 square foot shed he would be exempt from a building permit, but
would have to have a foundation. McGann said he would look into the issue and get back to the
commission.

The commission concurred with the remainder of the staff recommendations.

Planning Commission Regular Meeting - Minutes

April 11,2017
Page 2 of 3

3 0f 96


planner2
DRAFT


PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Greenwood said that in moving forward with the code change, they would amend the IRC to delete
the Part 2, which contains the building permit administration and write their own. McGann verified
that they would also write a new code chapter for amendments to the IRC. He wants to see a redline
of the code change with the amendments based off of the Alaska Housing Finance Corporation’s
(AHFC) amendments.

Greenwood said that concerning the AHFC, she doesn’t understand how one of the amendments
does not require fire sprinklers in garages. McGann said they would look at it closer. Pegau
wondered why one of the AHFC amendments would delete the use of naturally durable wood.
McGann responded that it was Alaska and that the term is not specific enough. Roemhildt verified
that the administration portion of the code also addresses enforcement.
10. PENDING CALENDAR
11. AUDIENCE PARTICIPATION
12. COMMISSION COMMENTS
Bird said she hoped to call in to the next meeting.
Frohnapfel said he wanted to change street names on a regular basis.

13. ADJOURNMENT

M/Pegau S/Frohnapfel to adjourn the Regular Meeting at 7:37 PM.
With no objection, the meeting was.adjourned.

Approved:

TomMcGann, Chair

Leif Stavig, Assistant Planner

Planning Commission Regular Meeting - Minutes
April 11,2017
Page 3 of 3

4 of 96


planner2
DRAFT


PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

THE STATE Department of Transportation
¢ and Public Facilities

AL
STATEWIDE AVIATION

Northern Region Aviation Leasing

GOVERNOR BILL WALKER 2301 Peger Road
Fairoanks, Alaska 99709-5399

Main: 907-451-2216

. TDD: 907-451-2363
April 10, 2017 FAX: 907-451-2253

www.dot.state.ak.us

RECEIVED
Re: Cordova Airport APE 13 2013
Lease ADA-71972 —~
Public Notice FCordovq
DISTRIBUTION

Enclosed is a Public Notice regarding a leasehold interest disposal of State land.
Public Notice is required by the Alaska Constitution.

We are sending you this copy for your information only; no action is required on your part.
However, you are welcome to post this notice in the public view.

If you have any questions, please call me at (907) 451-5201.
Sincerely,
L CLOG (_,gxu_(,
Diana M. Osborne
Airport Leasing Specialist
jkb
Enclosure: Public Notice

cc: Robert Mattson, Jr., Airport Manager

Distribution:

Chugach Alaska Corp., 3800 Centerpoint Dr., Ste. 601, Anchorage, AK 99503-5826
City of Cordova, PO Box 1210, Cordova, AK 99574
Eyak Corporation, PO Box 340, Cordova, AK 99574

“Keep Alaska Moving through service and infrastructure.”

5 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

PROPOSAL TO EXTEND A STATE AIRPORT LAND LEASE: The Alaska Department of
Transportation & Public Facilities proposes to extend Lease ADA-71972 (Lots 6A and 6B, Block
102), consisting of approximately 6,000 square feet, at Cordova Airport for an additional five (5)
years, to expire July 11, 2022. Applicant: Marc Cloward. Annual rent: $738.00. Authorized uses:
aviation — Operation and maintenance of a hangar and aircraft parking for Lessee’s private aircraft.

This is an application filed under AS 02.15.090(c), which allows the Department to grant the
proposed lease term extension without competition. Written comments must be received by

4:30 p.m., May 11, 2017, after which the Department will determine whether or not to extend the
lease. The Department’s decision will be sent only to persons who submit written comment or
objection to the Department, at the address and by the date and time specified in this notice, and
include their return address. Information is available from Diana M. Osborne, Aviation Leasing,
2301 Peger Road, Fairbanks, AK 99709-5399, (907) 451-5201. Anyone needing hearing impaired
accommodation may call TDD (907) 451-2363.

The Department reserves the right to correct technical defects, term, or purposes and may reject

any or all comments. B
s
BY, — £ 7

Tom Kowalczyk, CM
Acting Chief, Northern Region Aviation Leasing

DATE: Y [0/ 7

PLEASE LEAVE POSTED AND FULLY VISIBLE THROUGH MAY 11, 2017

Note: A person who removes, obscures or causes to be removed or obscured a notice posted in a
public place before the removal date stated in this notice is subject to disqualification from receiving
any lease, permit, or concession related to this notice.

6 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

. . Department of Transportation
THE STATE and Public Facilities

of
STATEWIDE AVIATION

Northern Region Aviation Leasing

GOVERNOR BILL WALKER . 2301 Peger Road
Faiirbanks, Alaska 99709-5399

Main:  907-451-2216

_ e DD 907-451-2363
April 17, 2017 KECEIVED FAX:  907-451-2053

www . dot.state,ak,us

AP 2 Gy

Re: Cordova Airport , ;
Permit ADA-72443 City of Cordovg
Public Notice

DISTRIBUTION
Enclosed is a Public Notice regarding a leasehold interest disposal of State land.
Public Notice is required by the Alaska Constitution.

We are sending you this copy for your information only; no action is required on your part.
However, you are welcome to post this notice in the public view.

If you have any questions, please call me at (907) 451-5201.

Sincerely,

I L:E:ﬁ i = rl__'__(/_:j_:'__

VI
Diana M. Osbore
Airport Leasing Specialist
jkb
Enclosure: Public Notice

cc: Robert Mattson, Jr., Airport Manager

Distribution:
Chugach Alaska Corp., 3800 Centerpoint Dr., Ste. 601, Anchorage, AK 99503-5826

City of Cordova, PO Box 1210, Cordova, AK-89574
Eyak Corporation, PO Box 340, Cordova, AK 99574

“Keep Alaska Moving through service and infrastructure.”

7 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

PROPOSAL TO ALLOW USE OF STATE AIRPORT LAND: The Alaska Department of
Transportation & Public Facilities proposes to allow the use of Parcel G, consisting of
approximately 150,000 square feet (ADA-72443), at Cordova Airport for one (1) year. Annual Rent:
$16,350.00. Applicant: Alaska Aerospace Corporation. Authorized uses: non-aviation -
temporary storage of Permittee owned property.

Competing applications or written comments must be received by 4:30 p.m., May 18, 2017, after
which the Department will determine whether or not to execute the permit. The Department's
decision will be sent only to persons who submit written comment or objection or a competing
application to the Department, at the address and by the date and time specified in this notice, and
include their return address. Information is available from Diana M. Osborne, Aviation Leasing,
2301 Peger Road, Fairbanks, AK 99709-5399, (907) 451-5201. Anyone needing hearing impaired
accommodation may call TDD (907) 451-2363.

The Department reserves the right to correct technical defects, term, or purposes and may reject
any or all applications or comments.

-i) f 1 -\\ ‘J ) - 4
BY: A ulope ka(c‘u \J
Penelope Adler, SRAWA, CM
Chief, Northern Region Aviation Leasing

paTE: (w13 2017

PLEASE LEAVE POSTED AND FULLY VISIBLE THROUGH MAY 18, 2017

Note: A person who removes, obscures or causes to be removed or obscured a notice posted in a
public place before the removal date stated in this notice is subject to disqualification from receiving
any lease, permit, or concession related to this notice.

8 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Bruce and Sally Campbell

314 Railroad Row, Cordova AK. 99574-0826 | 907-253-8250 | captsoup@hotmail.com

04/29/2017

Cordova City Council
City of Cordova
Cordova, Ak 99574

Subject: RFP Blocks 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park subdivision

Dear Cordova City Council,

We are writing to voice concerns regarding the RFP to develop lots 8 and 9, block 1 of the Odiak Park sub-division.
We appreciate the work that the City Council and Planning and Zoning Commission do......much of it volunteer
work. However, we feel this RFP is just a bad idea and as the closest adjacent land owner to lot # 9 we are
disappointed that the City did not notify us directly. Now, after the fact and quite by accident we saw the ad
yesterday for the RFP on the scanner channel. As a tax paying property owner of this community we feel the city
has an obligation to personally notify any home owner of any city action which may cause affect to a home owners
personal property. Sally and [ have been in emergency medical mode for months on end now. Our ability to pay
attention to anything other than basic survival has been limited and will continue to be so. Ata minimum we are
requesting that the city be understanding of our situation and allow us a little more latitude in our ability to be
involved on the processes of this RFP or other planning and zoning work. We urge the city to reconsider this RFP.
However, for now we will articulate our concerns and alternative options which occur to us at this time.

Concerns:

We have lived at this location (314 Railroad Row) since 1995, and at the time were told that block 9 was not
available for purchase, and in fact that it was a city easement which laid upon the old railroad boardwalk from
Cordova’s early years. We might have been interested in buying lot 9 at that time but it did not seem to be an
option. As you probably know we have collaborated with our neighbors Max and Cecelia Weise, along with Bret
and Cindy Bradford with an RFP response of our own proposing the purchase of the property. We have
considered how anybody might be able to develop lot 9; it’s difficult to imagine how it might be possible without
causing harm or having effects to our home and property............ and still be in compliance with the city’s own
regulations. While development options may appear feasible from looking at a map or plat of the area the “on the
ground” conditions say otherwise for following reasons:

e There is no easement from Railroad Row that would allow development access. The property would need
to be developed from Chase Ave on the SE side of the lot.

e Access from the SE side would have to overcome very steep slopes and/or cliffs; such as the 15 foot cliff
face directly behind our house and rising up from Chase Ave. It would be impossible to develop without
heavy blasting of the area which would be a safety hazard and could cause damage to several homes in
close proximity. Currently the only ground which is level enough to consider building on is approximately
81’ X 45’ or 3,645 sq. ft. of acreage and located adjacent to our property line. The amount of rock that
would need to be blasted and moved in order to allow an access road or cut and fill to create a buildable
pad would be cost prohibitive.

e Any building construction on the upper part of the lot would mean totally clearing the land and
construction at extreme close proximity to our home which would obscure any view we have, be noisy and

9 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

remove any sense of privacy we currently enjoy. Additionally this is a high wind area which is the result of
predominant easterly winds coming off Eyak Lake, past the hospital and then upslope through the existing
trees on lots 8 and 9. Removal of trees and shrubbery in the area will expose local homes directly to the
wind and result in wind damage each year.

e There are numerous existing legal encumbrances to the property which need to be considered: 1) the
sidewalk and ROW clearing limits off Chase Avenue 2) The green belt which is designated and showing on
city plats and required as a condition of sale within adjacent lots 10, 11 & 12. How does the city intend to
be consistent with it's greenbelt management direction? 3) An easement for a city water line which has
been missed in the city plats. 4) The existing easement for the old boardwalk or railroad bed. Cumulatively
the above easements all would reflect a reduction in acreage available for development, possibly resulting
in acreage less than the city minimum requirement of 5,000 sq. ft.

e The greenbelt mentioned above would be obliterated where it crosses behind our home. Currently the
greenbelt is intact and provides a mix of positive aesthetics for the homeowners and the public. The green
belt is visually pleasing and provides a corridor of cover and is a feeding source for a variety of wildlife and
birds such as squirrels, voles, eagles, humming birds, varied thrush, robins, stellers jays, pine siskins,
winter wrens and juncos. Many varieties of birds also nest here. I don’t believe eagle nests exist but the
greenbelt provides eagles with a cruise zone by which they hunt and roost. The Forest Service has issued a
bird pamphlet named “The birds of Cordova and Copper River Delta” which is a checklist of bird’s
occurring in our area. Of that listing, according to USFS Wildlife Biologist Milo Burcham there are at least
20 different varieties of birds that also reside within town.

e The homes along Railroad Row are all part of the early historic railroad era of Cordova. Our house in fact
was the home of the railroad superintendent. It was built in 1909 and most other homes along this section
of Railroad Row where built about the same time or shortly thereafter. This is where all the early railroad
employees and their families lived. As I understand it the railroad ran approximately where Chase Ave. is
now and the boardwalk existed on the SE side of our property line directly in the middle of lots 8 and 9.
The entire area is rife with historic relics of early Cordova including evidence of the early electrical system,
railroad artifacts, household artifacts and even the original wooden water lines. Having worked with but
retired from the USFS here locally for many years [ am very familiar with the National Historic
Preservation Act and the strict requirements for the process of reviewing projects that include historic
properties and the importance of abiding by the applicable laws. I don’t know exactly how that translates
to city governments but suspect there are laws that apply which the city and home owners are required to
comply with.

Alternative Property Management Proposal:

We believe the city is on the right track in the designation of a greenbelt above Chase Avenue. It makes great sense
to continue and extend this greenbelt especially in consideration of the points | have made above. The greenbelt
could be cooperatively managed between the local home owners, the local Audubon Society, the City and the
Historical Society. It would be of benefit to the community, protect birds and wildlife, and protect the existing
historical resources. The remaining acreage, less other easements and encumbrances could be purchased by the
home owners.

Cc: Cordova Planning Commission

Cordova Historic Preservation Commission

Sincerely,

/S/ Bruce and Sally Campbell
Page 2

10 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Planner’s Report

To: Planning Commission

From: Planning Staff

Date: 5/3/2017

Re: Recent Activities and Updates

Two building permits issued since the last meeting.

Sunnyside Drive street sign has been installed.

Working with CTC on Conditional Use Permit for cell tower. Need to schedule Special Meeting.
Working through development terms for lease with option to purchase for Jensen’s proposed
development on Lot 20, Block 23, Original Townsite.

Provided information to the public on multiple inquiries about building, setbacks, and zoning
regulations.

Researched plats, tax lots, resolutions and provided historical variance and other information to City
Manager regarding a complaint. Created letters and coordination on solution.

State has received grant for Adams Avenue sidewalks city is awaiting project agreement.

Working with Copper River Watershed Project on Land Use Permit for treatment of invasive plant
species on city property.

Tideland permit for Trident’s outfall lines passed City Council.

Working on work flow analysis and new budget format.

Tracking grant and loan balance for post LT2 projects.

Completed draft RFP for Rural Development Grant/Loan for Refuse. Rich reviewed, will incorporate
edits and send to Rural Development for review.

Will be acting Public Works Director through May 8.

11 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

AGENDA ITEM # 9a
Planning Commission Meeting Date: 5/9/2017

PLANNING COMMISSION COMMUNICATION FORM

FROM: Planning Staff
DATE: 5/3/17
ITEM: Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
NEXT STEP: Vote
INFORMATION
~ X MOTION
RESOLUTION

I. REQUEST OR ISSUE:

Requested Actions:  Approve Variance from Front and Side Setbacks

Applicant: RJ Kopchak

Address: 120 West Davis

Legal Description: West Sixteen Feet (16”) of Lot Two (2), Block “A”, of the Original Townsite of
Cordova, referred to Lot 2 in this memo

Parcel Number: 02-060-755-A
Zoning: Medium Density Residence District
Lot Area: 1920 sq. ft.

RJ Kopchak is requesting a variance to be able to build 5 feet from the front property line instead of
required 10-foot setback and 1 foot from each side property line instead of the required 5-foot setback.

The Kopchaks own Lot 1A and Lot 2 (see Attachment B). Their single-family home is located on Lot 1A and

Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
Page 1 of 7

12 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

an accessory building is on Lot 2, which is the lot that the variance is being requested for. Both lots are
nonconforming and under the minimum required lot size of 4,000 square feet. They were legally subdivided
prior to zoning regulations Lot 1A has a 5-foot access easement on the east side to accommodate access to the
Phillips property. Lot 2 is 16 feet wide. If the existing nonconforming building on Lot 2 is destroyed, a new
building would be required to meet setbacks, which allows a buildable width of 6 feet. There have been
numerous discussions by the commission and City Council about the need for affordable single-family
housing and the only way to realistically develop the lot is with a variance. This neighborhood has many legal
nonconforming lots and buildings and with some additional consideration does offer smaller lots and the
opportunity for affordable housing.

II. RECOMMENDED ACTION / NEXT STEP:

“I move that the Planning Commission grant the variance request by RJ Kopchak with the special conditions
contained within the staff report.”

Staft have multiple recommendations that are incorporated into the recommended special conditions and
further detailed in the suggested findings:

1. Staff recommend granting the variance for the west side setback so the applicant would be able to
construct the building within 1 foot of the lot line. If the applicant chooses to construct the covered
walkway, staff recommend a replat of Lot 1A and Lot 2. The replat would move the west lot line of
Lot 2 to encompass the access easement on Lot 1A. This would allow the attached covered walkway,
area for snow shedding, and the existing access easement to be contained on a single lot. Also, this
adjustment would make the best use of unbuildable square footage (access easement). The remaining
square footage of Lot 1A would provide adequate buildable space to meet current setbacks. If the
applicant chooses to not construct the covered walkway, a replat is unnecessary with the variance.
Granting the variance with Special Condition 2 below allows for either option.

2. Staff recommend granting the variance for the east side setback so the applicant would be able to
construct the building within 1 foot of the lot line. If the replat described above occurred and the
current building was destroyed, the buildable lot width would increase slightly to 11 feet, but would
still be constrained in width due to the access easement. The eaves of the

3. Staff recommend not granting the variance from the front setback. The Observation Avenue
neighborhood currently has limited off street parking, and difficult line of site for drivers and winter
conditions worsen the congestion in the area. While many of the lots are smaller and have
grandfathered buildings, continuing to decrease required front setbacks will not help to move away
from the traffic congestion and lack of off street parking.

Special Conditions:
1. The front setback will be 10 feet.

2. The building and all appurtenances will be contained within one lot. If the covered walkway is
constructed, a replat will move the west lot line to encompass the attached covered walkway, area for
snow shedding, and the existing access easement.

Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
Page 2 of 7

13 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

III.  FISCAL IMPACTS:

Possible increased property value and tax base.

IV.  BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

A complete application was submitted on April 27%

V. LEGAL ISSUES:

Applicable Code:

18.24.040 — Front Yard.
There shall be a front yard in the R medium density district of not less than ten feet from curb
line.

18.24.050 - Rear yard.
There shall be a rear yard in the R medium density district of not less than twenty-five percent of
the depth of the 1ot but such yard need not exceed fifteen feet.

18.24.060 - Side yard.
A. There shall be a side yard in the R medium density district of not less than five feet. The
minimum side yard on the street side of a corner shall be ten feet.

18.64.020 Variances.
An application has been filed pursuant to this section of code. Below is review of the variance
criteria.
Suggested Findings:
a. That there are exceptional physical circumstances or conditions applicable to the property or to its

intended use or development which do not apply generally to the other properties in the same land
use district.

This condition is met for the variance from the required side setbacks. This neighborhood was legally
subdivided prior to zoning regulations which produced numerous nonconforming lots and buildings in one
neighborhood. This neighborhood differs from the rest of the medium density district with the number of the
nonconforming lots and buildings, and the narrower 30-foot ROW. These legal nonconforming issues and
smaller ROWs make it difficult to meet required setbacks and have a single-family residences.

This condition is not met for the variance from the required front setback. The lot is 120 feet from front to
back, providing ample room for buildable area behind the proposed building.

b. That the strict application of the provisions of this title would result in practical difficulties or
unnecessary hardship.

This condition is met for the variance from the required side setbacks. The strict enforcement of this title
would eliminate new construction of a single family residence. The lot is 16 feet wide and to build to meet

Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
Page 3 of 7

14 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

setbacks would leave 6 feet of buildable width.

This condition is not met for the variance from the required front setback. The applicant is proposing to
construct the building 5 feet from the front property line. There is no practical difficulty or unnecessary
hardship for the applicant to reduce the footprint of the building 5 additional feet or move the building 5 feet
closer to the rear of the lot.

C. That the granting of the variance will not result in material damage or prejudice to other properties
in the vicinity nor be detrimental to the public health, safety or welfare.

This condition is met for the variance from the required side setbacks. The granting of this variance will not
result in material damage or prejudice to other property owners. The current building is old and in need of
repair. Replacing this building will increase property values in the neighborhood. The proposal includes fire
safety measures above the required city code. The proposal will eliminate snow sliding from the roof to
existing neighbor’s property who also has a legal nonconforming building. The existing building eaves
extend up to the side lot line, while the proposed building is setback 1 foot.

This condition is not met for the variance from the required front setback. The granting of the front setback
could be avoided by shorting the building or extending the building towards the rear of the property. The
proposed setback for the front moves the building 3 feet closer to the front lot line impacting the already
limited visibility and congestion in the area.

d. That the granting of the variance will not be contrary to the objectives of the comprehensive plan.

This condition is met for the variance from the required side setbacks. The granting of this variance will not
be contrary to the comprehensive plan; it will help to meet development strategies such as:

e Plan for organized future growth and development.

¢ Anticipate and respond to trends in development patterns.

e Maintain and provide for a balanced and complementary pattern of land uses.

e Protect the citizens of the community and the investments that have been made.

e Protect property values. The variance can be appealed to the board of adjustments.

This condition is not met for the variance from the required front setback. The building can still be
constructed and meet the front setback.

VI. CONFLICTS OR ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES:

Traffic congestion is a concern in the neighborhood due to many nonconforming buildings and lots with no
off-street parking.

Response from Public Works:

Sam

My thoughts on this proposal.

With the existing parking congestion that already exist in the area, and with no off City right of way
parking, I feel it would be a mistake to narrow any setbacks along the City right of way,

Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
Page 4 of 7

15 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Bill Howard
Public Works Supervisor

Response from Fire and Public Safety:
Good afternoon Sam.

I would like to see the plans prior to approval that show Mr. Kopchak will meet the International
Residential Code(IRC) for an Exterior and or Interior Fire Wall. For the Protection of both Properties.

Paul Trumblee

VII. SUMMARY AND ALTERNATIVES:

The variance can be granted, denied or additional special conditions may be added by the commission.

Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
Page 5 of 7

16 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

ATTACHMENT A

COUNCIL
AVENUE

WATER STREET

r ] i} : 4 Ll 160t
1 A r Feet :

Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
Page 6 of 7

17 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

ATTACHMENT B

=
[2k]
E
b
m
(4]
— B =
2 om . o
N=l o A
o & /1 Wesl 16 Feet of Lot 2 Kopcohak 1920 Sq. Fest
e ;
=t =t
A B
[an)]
%
<=
=80
o Lm.a.
-+ m m.
P T
(o]
2
&=
o
B
2
']
|

S "
=

H

FTO[ECT ATED

Variance Request — RJ Kopchak
Page 7 of 7

18 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Print or type requested information. Incomplete applications will be returned to the applicant and will

INSTRUCTIONS

delay the processing of your request. All applications must be filed with the Planning Department
21 days prior to the next Planning Commission meeting date.

£ /APPLICANTINFORMATION A
Name WO opeda<
Address FOPox WU Gl e . 995749

Telephone [home]

SO7-A3 - NTS

Business Name

Business Address

Telephone [husiresst— Ci&LL

50% Fo\ 3574

Business FAX

Project architect/engineer

Address of architect/engineer

Telephone of architect/engineer

:PR@PERWIRROHEOII’-EINFER-M_NHIGN

Address of subject property

Parcel identification number

Property owner [name/address]

Y f'%NQCLPx\/ EOFCH AR - BOY (1o
RIOCAA, A 2D 57

Current zoning

Proposed use

NEWS ERStencTiorl ORd O FeCTPeRIT

Construction start date

MYy KROVT

Page 1

19 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

e

The Planning and Zoning Commission may only approve the variance if the Commission finds that
ALL of the following 4 standards are satisfied. Each standard must have a response in as much
detail as it takes to explain how your project satisfies the standard. Use additional paper if needed.

Exceptional physical circumstances or conditions that apply to the property or to its intended use
or development which do not apply generally to the other properties in the same land use district.
EXPLAIN: €U RRelY] LAVD VUgE DECE\PIOOD DO KOT Wbk ikC
ACCOUNT “THE VMQUE JORIVRE OF —THe WIDAVS) 0BG MDA WUE
ARER . ARESE ARE Al WOKBE SITE LOTS T S0 SIMARTY

\ 1= LASD USE PISTRANAT E{EGO\EEP{‘Q\\TB
/roﬂrg% tg'a:;-‘ ‘mggg’“,{fé L.  DEVLISYE

That the strict application of the provisions of this title would result in practical difficulties or
unnecessary hardship.
EXPLAN: )  @OSTEOCIDID 1S —The O S0um oS —tTo

BOTH S0 (SSUES AND FRE SRFETY,

g TR 7

I3 g .,. .‘_ '-‘;'.‘".1. .'__’S._.. ..." ._-..-.;__I..._,:_I :;. - _ o e L O S . ' _"._. et .:_- A AT . ‘_l
That the granting of the variance will not resuit in material damage or prejudice to other
properties in the vicinity nor be detrimental to the public health, safety or welfare.

EXPLANA e VAIANtE  witi- HTPROVE . FIRE SPFETY
and AAAESS  SH0cus \BHVES

T T T A e ]

That the granting of the variance will not be contrary to the objectives of the comprehensive plan.

EXPLAIN: 1§ qpg. comprehenave- Plan 1o irlended KO Improvc
ThE enevay ef{llwnw( ,\‘\)e s:v?e“\y oA Q@sy AUES QS)
cthizens Cegpthar Womés —this reQuest S In @MP\@M@ .

[OTHER REQUIREMENTS -
1. A legal description of the property involved.

2. Site and Building Plan: Plot plan showing the location of all existing and proposed buildings
or improvements, elevations of such buildings or alterations, and such other data as may be
reguired.

3. Evidence of the ability and intention of the applicant to proceed in accordance with the plans
within six months after the effective date of the variance.

|

20 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Variance Request

Rather that rehabilitating an existing building that has seen better days | propose to do new
construction with energy efficiency, fire safety, and snow disposal issues addressed. The current building
(14%40) was built about 1918. Snow dumps from a hip roof into an approximately 3-foot gap between
two existing buildings, the adjoining building also dumps snow there. New construction would reduce
the snow by half by redirecting the buildings snow to the east.

Currently, should either existing building catch fire the close eaves will assure both are involved. The
new construction would include a zero-penetration firewall with a parapet along the east side to
prevent fire from spreading from/to the adjacent building. A low slope roof designed to hold snow, and
a new covered walkway would prevent snow from impacting a platted easement on the west side that
provides access to the Curren property, and serves both this building and my house.

A proposed five-foot setback is well within the neighborhood “norm”, as on West Davis Ave. from first
street to the cliff above the harbor almost all buildings are much closer than this. The proposed project
is well within neighborhood norms for land use. All the houses (and lot lines) in our corner of town are
somewhat unique in how they use and occupy the land here. The lots and houses meander. Rebuilding
on this lot using the setbacks that are already established in the neighborhood will add value {which
increases city taxes) improve the safety of the building, and improve the look of the street front. No
existing neighborhood access and/or uses of this or adjoining land will be affected by this project. The
biggest change is in allowing the new building setback three feet closer the street but within the area
previously occupied by a porch and stairway access which were set back from the street about 4 % feet.
They were removed and have not yet been replaced.

Without the variance, | will repair the roof, replace the porch and stairs that were previously removed,
replace windows and doors, and fix the foundation on the current footprint. This will add no value to
our community and will perpetuate a fire hazard that can be easily corrected through new construction.

RJ Kopchak
Box 1126

CDV.AK. 99574

21 of 96



/4

PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

e FRLLIPLL — WO TENCTRAT G RD

'l

{"?a.w?'d. - ’qumdd by cade

pperty e coVeRED  WRLRIAL
: § Necess Erdutta



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

N

(=W E-E-T AN ]
’ S (DeEWwnLI4

—

Al ! .
A= T«- | ﬁ &l
Aeess, . _
ShSEAENT —

C\.)‘RRE.N- BUWDING —
S -
____—_—.—_-_-

23 of 96



96 40 ¥7¢

ik

TANK
.A___.._ 10’ .__,_,_,_?. N
Muuens y SRR
L PIN FOUND ol
bl V =
R Lot Pin Too0
AT BACK LWE

~ Weer Dave AV‘E e

T
P

t
|
I
|

u/OLv EOUWLDING  LINE

14 Wipe % 44 Lowa
PoUNBRTIN & STRUOCTURE

L T

. TN T, . "o, T

A\

|

ONILITN dV1NDO3TH NOISSININOD DNINNV1d

NS

RS T

LT0C ‘6 AVIN



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

nh

39‘
I A

Jeom Grade

25 of 96

WET! ELEVATION




96 40 9¢

RS RIT - Kepehak

MocLexs House

v

e

it e kot O P SN = | e TS e oo ;

z?!ﬂ 'QOU J ’ = JE N B

“__.....,_.__ S W— T PP PO — . e e —— g S l #
KOpeHAR SHOF

{-BLE.em\,c':“ T"“ chr

e MO Py OIYS
I Cure® POX
|
|

e i)
T’W\ }{’mw c\

| 1
! ; " " 1 i s 1 -
l/f‘“ %\m‘! RI) A #t 53 ‘2® 2 A1 " e

A

» Y SR N M NS e
EJACC_E_.SS iy i ( L}Z ;L /f\ ; \
EASEMENT | wﬂhd ’ | %
= ff e A A e e e e Lot LNE i,
T R . k 2
l CURRENT - kS BU\LT — \ g
ll =
N WA R <

LT0C ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dV1NDO3TH NOISSININOD DNINNV1d



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017

1 421

118

W

/

\‘\‘

A

[ (7]

VA AV A

i N R L =S
J B/I%4 ;L/tre st

G2

27 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

. AN {
R Vi 13 k ! : 5 f 1AL
v ot
’ >

7
| <t
((p)]

7
l

28 of 96


planner2
Snapshot


mmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmm

T O
s
=

AN
55,
¥

29 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

AGENDA ITEM # 9b
Planning Commission Meeting Date: 5/9/2017

PLANNING COMMISSION COMMUNICATION FORM

FROM: Planning Staff
DATE: 5/2/2017
ITEM: Site Plan Review — Ocean Beauty Seafoods Modular Housing
NEXT STEP: Recommendation to City Council
INFORMATION
~ X MOTION
RESOLUTION

I. REQUEST OR ISSUE:

Requested Actions: Site Plan Review

Applicant: Ocean Beauty

Address: 205 Industry Road

Legal Description: Lot 2A, Block 2, Cordova Industrial Park
Parcel Number: 02-060-223

Zoning: Waterfront Industrial District

Lot Area: 30,684 sq. ft.

Ocean Beauty is proposing to construct modular bunkhouses.

II. RECOMMENDED ACTION / NEXT STEP:

“I move that the Planning Commission recommend to City Council to approve the Site Plan Review

Site Plan Review — Ocean Beauty Seafoods Modular Housing
Page 1 of 5

30 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

requested by Ocean Beauty to install modular bunkhouses on Lot 2A, Block 3, Cordova Industrial Park
based on the findings and with the special conditions as contained in the staff report.”

I11.

FISCAL IMPACTS:

New structure expands city property tax base.

Iv.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

Applicable Code:

Chapter 18.33 ZONING — WATERFRONT INDUSTRIAL DISTRICT
The following are the permitted principal uses and structures in the waterfront industrial district:
A. Marine sales;

B. Open wet moorage;

C. Covered wet moorage;

D. Passenger staging facility,

E. Haulout facilities,

F. Marine construction, repair and dismantling;

G. Cargo terminal;

H. Cargo handling and marine-oriented staging area;

L. Fish and seafood processing;

J. Warehousing and wholesaling;

K. Open storage for marine-related facilities,

L. Fuel storage and sales.

Section 18.33.030 - Permitted accessory uses and structures.

A. Bunkhouses in conjunction with permitted principal uses;

B. Residential dwelling for watchman or caretaker employed on the premises, or owner-operator and
members of his family, in conjunction with permitted principal uses;

C. Retail business when accessory to a permitted principal use.

Ocean Beauty is proposing to install modular bunkhouses which is a permitted accessory use and
structure.

Section 18.42.010 ZONING — SITE PLAN REVIEW — Purpose.

Whenever required by this code or the city council, a site plan review shall be completed by the
planning commission with a recommendation to the city council. Prior to the issuance of a building
permit, the city council must approve the site plan for the project.

Section 18.42.030 ZONING — SITE PLAN REVIEW — Required Information.

The site plan to be submitted as required herein shall contain the following information. If any of the
information requested herein is not applicable to a given project, the reasons for the non-
applicability of the information requested shall be stated in the site plan:

1. Name, address and phone number of owner/developer;

2. Legal description of property;

3. A scale of not less than 1" = 20';

4. Date, north point and scale;

Site Plan Review — Ocean Beauty Seafoods Modular Housing

Page 2 of 5

31 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

5. The dimensions of all lot and property lines, showing the relationship of the subject property to
abutting properties;

6. The zoning and siting of all structures on the subject property and abutting properties;,

7. The location of each proposed structure in the development area, the use or uses to be contained
therein, the number of stories, gross building area, distances between structures and lot lines, setback
lines and approximate location of vehicular entrances and loading points;

8. The location of all existing and proposed drives and parking areas with the number of parking
and/or loading spaces provided and the location and right-of-way widths of all abutting streets;

9. Location and height of all walls, fences and screen plantings, including a general plan for the
landscaping of the development and the method by which landscaping is to be accomplished and be
maintained,

10. Types of surfacing, such as paving, turfing or gravel to be used at the various locations,

11. A grading plan of the area demonstrating the proposed method of storm drainage;

12. Size and location of proposed sewer and water lines and connections;

13. Front and side elevations of proposed structures;

14. Exterior finish and color.

Section 18.08.010 ZONING — DEFINITIONS
"Building area" means the total of areas taken on a horizontal plane at the main grade level of the
principal building and all accessory buildings, exclusive of steps.

With this definition, the building area is 960 square feet, as indicated in the application.

Chapter 18.48 ZONING — OFF-STREET PARKING, LOADING AND UNLOADING
Off-street parking for bunkhouses is not explicitly called out in Section 18.46.060 — Off-Street
Parking Requirements.

Section 18.48.080

The planning commission may reduce the required number of parking spaces if the commission
determines that an unreasonable amount parking spaces is required or that the required number of
spaces does not meet the city's development goals or its land use needs.

This section provides the Planning Commission the ability to adjust parking requirements as needed
to meet the land use goals. Staff recommend not requiring additional parking for the seasonal workers
who will be using the bunkhouse. The workers are typically from out of state or country and do not
have vehicles.

Special Conditions:

L.

The Planning Department must be in receipt of an approved Plan Review from the State of Alaska
Fire Marshal prior to issuance of a Building Permit.

The Planning Department must be in receipt of an approved Water/Sewer Connection Permit prior to
issuance of a Building Permit.

Parking spaces will not be required for the modular bunkhouses.

Site Plan Review — Ocean Beauty Seafoods Modular Housing

Page 3 of 5

32 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

V. LEGAL ISSUES:

N/A

VI. CONFLICTS OR ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES:

N/A

VII. SUMMARY AND ALTERNATIVES:

N/A

Site Plan Review — Ocean Beauty Seafoods Modular Housing
Page 4 of 5

33 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Attachment A — Location Map

Site Plan Review — Ocean Beauty Seafoods Modular Housing
Page 5 of 5

34 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017

INSTRUCTIONS
Print or type requested information. Incomplete
applications will be returned to the applicant and
will delay the processing of your request. All
applications must be filed with the Planning
Department 21 days prior to the next Planning
Commission meeting date.

ame

Site Plan Review varies
Residential $50
Multi-Family $100
Commercial $150
Industrial $200

_

Faeiuty ContrAcmes LG

Address

Box 203 Cocdovia

Telephone [home]

Qo7 _g24 TICS

Business Name

Business Address

Telephone [business]

Business FAX

907 42¢ "176%

Project architect/engineer

<STEPHEN PETERS Arcu!TiECTS

Address of architect/engineer

Joz WATER. 3 Ak 9390 |

Telephone of architect/engineer

Ketenmrand,

907 247 7017

35 of 96

WA
q% 1071

Address of subject property 20b JIM Pook. LAN_ﬁ_
Parcel identification number Browk 2, Lot 2A  (oeowa INOusTRIAL FARE
Property owner [name/address] OC@LM_SQ@QS_E&K 716739  Seam
Current zoning WATEZ ERoNT _ INDUSTRIAL
Proposed use TEMPoRARN HQ_\\S: NG
Construction start date 5 /18| 2017
WAA —
Page 1



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Owner of property (if different than applicant). Ocenny REAUTY SEAFooDS
If multiple owners, list names and addresses PO Powe _10-13:;

of each and indicate ownership interest.
Attach additional sheet if necessary. SEANLE, WA 98167

Real Estate Firm/Broker handling sale of
property. Provide name and address. Note:
If you do not own the property, you must
provide a copy of a Purchase Agreement or
instrument acceptable to the city indicating
the owner is fully aware of, and in agreement
with, the requested action.

City Business License Permit Number (if
applicable) . (p‘l 76‘ :

By the signature(s) attached hereto, | (we) certify that the information provided within this application
and accompanying documentation is, to the best of my (our) knowledge, true and accurate.
Furthermore, | (we) hereby authorize the City and its representatives to enter the property associated
with this application for purposes of conducting necessary site inspections.

By: Lﬁ) QLH\JQA,W By:

(Signature) (Signature)

Name: BPN\D m& MU LAY Name:

(Type/Print) (Type/Print)

Date: %C\L. 27, 2017 Date:
Appeal Procedures: A decision of the Planning Commission may be appealed to the Board of

Adjustment. An appeal must be filed in writing with the City Clerk within ten (10) days of the decision.
In accordance with the procedures outlined in Section 18.64.030 of the City of Cordova Zoning Code.

Page 2

36 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

A zoning compliance permit for property within the City of Cordova expires eighteen (18) months
after the date it is issued. Excavation is not considered construction.

1. Please describe the proposed construction/alteration and intended use:

(&
2. Please give dimensions and square footage of construction: 9D _S.f. RoilDine ARCA
3. Intended use: { }Single Family { }Duplex { }Multifamily {><@Commercial/Industrial
{ }Home Occupation (describe) { }Mobile Building { }Change of use
4. No. of Living Units: lg 5. No. of Bedrooms:
6. Has a variance been granted? { Yres {}No
7. Isthere anew: { }Garage? { }Carport? Is it attached to the residence? { }Yes {X }No
8. Is there an apartment above the garage? { }ves {¥ }No
9. Off-street parking: Existing__ N/ Proposed

10. Required Setbacks: Front 20  Left Side_ O Right side__ O Rear_O Height_O

11. Proposed Setbacks: Front_(o3 Left Side r_lrg Rightside_/0’ Rear_zo©  Height_{ &
12. Sewage Disposal:

{ }Private marine outfall: { }Existing {A }New Specify owner/location:
{ }Private on-site sewer: { }ADEG Certification Attached
NOTE: Property owners with a private system need an ADEC permit showing sewer system is operational before Permit
can be issued. Please contact ADEGC at (907) 225-6200

13. Water supply: { }Cistern (show on site plan) {D{City
14. Is the construction occurring on a grandfathered structure (build prior to August 7,1967)? ﬂn
15. Is there a building currently on the property? {x}Yes { INo

16. Which licensed surveyor will be doing your foundation/as-built Survey?

17. Is your driveway exit and adjoining roads shown on the site plan? {X }Yes { }No
Are you building a new driveway that exits onto a State road or highway? { Yes §}No
If YES, an ADOT Driveway Permit is required. (See bottom page 4)

18. Does this property contain drainages, creeks, wetlands, or other water features? { }Yes {X }No
Does your lot abut salt water? { }Yes {<INo
Have you or will you be using fill to develop your lot?  { }Yes {x }No

(If you answered YES to any of the above three questions, you may need to contact the U.S. Army Carps of Engineers or

other State agencies about additional permitting requirements.. Please see Planning staff for information.)

19. Is this permit for a tax-exempt use? { }Yes & }No

20. Has a Conditional Use Permit been issued? { }Yes {<}No

21. Is this permit for a mobile building? { }res {¢INo
Year Model Serial No.

22. |s your property within a Flood Plain or Coastal Zone? (see staff for interpretation) '\‘0
Elevation Certificate/Flood Hazard form attached

Page 3

37 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Parking: Each residential dwelling unit must have at least two (2) vehicular off-street parking spaces.
or industrial uses can be determined by consulting the Planning Department.

Water and Sewer: Applicants must obtain a water/sewer application from City Hall. Fees vary. ~

Sewage Disposal: All proposed sewage systems outside of City Limits (unrestricted district) must

be designed by a registered professional engineer. The engineer must submit the proposed design to
the Department of Environmental Conservation (DEC) for approval. A DEC "Certificate to Install” must
be attached to the zoning permit application.

Site plan, Building Height, and Building plan: Two copies of a site, building height, and building
plan, drawn to scale (1"=x'), must be submitted with the.application. Plans must show all property
lines, roads or water ways abutting the lot, the water tank, sewer lines, drain fields (if applicable),
proposed setback distances, and parking areas. Plans should identify existing or proposed foundation
location and extensions beyond the foundation, landings, decks, porches, and overhangs.

Please include a building height (elevation) drawing. As-buift surveys prepared by a licensed land
surveyor to establish the location of existing improvements on the property may be submitted within
60 days of issuance of Zoning Permit. Building without an as-built survey is done at your own risk.

Snow and Wind loads: 100 Ibs. per square foot ground snow load and 120 mph wind load \/

Lot and Yard Regulations: Comices, canopies, eaves or other similar architectural features not

Seismic Zone: D /

State-Owned Roads in Cordova
Lake Avenue
_ Power Creek Road
Copper River Highway/New England Cannery Road
Whitshed Road

Parking is permitted in the setbacks. The number of parking spaces required for public, commercial, v/

: . \
providing additional floor space within the building may extend into a required yard not to exceed two ft.

v

4

Page 4

38 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Facility Contractors LLC
PO Box 2034

Cordova, Alaska 99574
907-424-7765

April 27, 2017

Samantha Greenwood
City of Cordova - Planner
602 Railroad Ave.
Cordova, Ak 99574

RE: Ocean Beauty Temporary Housing Application

Ocean Beauty Seafoods and Facility Contractors LLC are proposing to install 6 temporary

housing units on Ocean Beauty's property in Cordova. The units at 8’ wide by 40’ long by 8.5’

high. They will be stacked 2 high. They are constructed of corrugated steel and are light green
in color. Attached is a site plan as required, as well as civil and architectural design.

Plans have been submitted to the State Fire Marshal's Office for Fire and Life Safety Plan
Review and approval.

Please be advised of the following:

A. This will be temporary housing used exclusively by Ocean Beauty employees. These
workers do not have vehicles on site, so no additional parking has been added at the
site.

B. Temporary housing is seasonal in the summer and fall, and not during winter. Space
has been provided for snow removal around the perimeter of the new units but it is not
anticipated that there will be regular snow removal from the site, so no snow removal
plan is included.

C. The surface of the site will be gravel excepting concrete pads at each door and bottom
of stairs.

D. The site is currently elevated 8" above surrounding grade. The pad for the housing units

will have minimal to no grade. Drainage is to existing storm drains on Jim Poor Lane.
Thank you for your consideration of this site plan application.

Respectfully,

N2 Lk

David Roemhildt
Facility Contractors LLC

39 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017

CODE ANALYSIS

Seafood Lane, Cordova Industrial park—commecial bunk house structure
Cordova, AK 99574

International Building Code — 2009 Edition as adopted by the SOA
Zoning:  Waterfront Industrial

Height: Per IBC

Setbacks: 20 Front, Per IBC Rear and Sides

Parking:  Seasonal use only with staff that have no vehicles

WIND LOAD: 120 MPH, EXP C, GROUND SNOW LOAD: 100 PSF, SEISMIC ZONE: D.

|_OCCUPANCY
Residential /R2:

Level 1: Residential= 960 s.f.
Level 2: Residential= 960 s.i.
Total= 1,920 s.f.

I_TYPE OF CONSTRUCTION

Type 1B
Allowable Ht/Area per Table 503: 4 Story/16000

Non—Separated Uses per 302.3.1

Non—Protected Openings per Section 705.3/Exception for Buildings on the same Lot
Minimun Fire Separation to PL = 10", HR FR required Table 602

ll._ OCCUPANT LOAD

rea Factor Occupants Load
FIRST FLOOR
Residential 960 s.f. 200/s.f. R2 5(18 Applied)
SECOND FLOOR
Residential 960 s.f. 200/s.. R2 5(18 Applied)

Exits: 1 Req/1 Provided Each Unit/Each Level e

(6 Occupants Max. per Unit)
36

Total 36

GENERAL NOTES

Comply with all provisions of the "International® codes as adopted by the State of Alagka. Indications
regarding *Unifarm” codes are for reference purposes anly.
1. Al work shall_conform to all gpplicable codes, including the latest adopted editions of the IBC, IFC,
IMC, IPC, IRC, UBC, UFC, UMC, UPC, NEC, ond ADA Accessibility Guidelines

2. Contractor shall verify dl site conditions and buiding dimensions prior to procesding with the wark.
Any variation from the conditions and dimensions shown on the drawing shall be reported to the Owner
for resolution prior to construction. Written dimensions take precedence over scaled dimansions,
Dimensions are to centerline of columns or to face of framing, unless otherwise noted.

The Work

The work consists of the construction of foundations and sitework and installation of prefabricated
connex bunk/bath units on 2 levels. Electrical, water, and waste service lines and related site work.
Wiring, fighting and mechanical work for the units is existing. Units approved previously by PR

2014une1016.

3. The general conditions for the controct for construction, ALA. document A-201 shall be applicable
to dl portions of work performed under this contract as if here m bound.

4. All_contractars performing work under this contract shall obtain copies of the above referenced
dacument and fully acquaint themselves with oppliccble provisions. failure to obiain copies sholl not
Toliave the Gontractar Jrom full Gomplionoa

5, Bicder Desian. Electreal Servce Instalation by llcensed Electricc Contractor. Provide necessary
documentation to regulatory authorities and obtain necessary per

Bidder Design. Mechonical contractor shall provide o layaut of water and waste ines. Notural
Ventlation of Units to be verifiad /provided per IMC. Co-ordinate dil Work with Buldng Ownar.

7. Mechanical work under this proposal consists of providing water and waste service lines. Bidder
design, decuments shall be submitted for approval by governing authority prior to commencing the
work and the work must be carried out in the manner and times prescribed by the goveming outhority.
Co—ordinate all Work with Building Owner.

8 The owners representative, Stephen Peters Architects, without invalidating the comstruction contract,
may order extra work, alter, add to o deduct from the contract work. The contract sum and time will
be odjusted accordgly by written chonge order. the ownwer may contract with others to perform
portions of the work Under separcte agreement.

9 Al revisions to contract for construction must be approved by Stephen Peters Architects by written
change ordar with cast and time detarmined prior to commancement of the work. fiald ardsra may be
fssued for o change in the work with cost and time issues fo be determined ot o later time ot the
option of Stephen Peters Architects.

10. Ths sontractor shall maintain one (1) complet et of record” prints on tho job site for maitaing
alel record. Al changes made In ne work shall be gcaurolely recarded in red Ik therean. Upon

Gompietion of tha project ond prior o Tal paymant tha Goniractor shall delver the record se

prints e copled of @ manutaetirers Morature of all Matarals, squipment and devicss mstalied with

the work. operations manud's and warranty information shall be provided With the remaning

information

11. Prior to submitting a bid dl subcontractors are respansible for visiting and inspecting the site
conditions and reporting discrepancles between the plana and existing conditions to Stephen Peters
Architects for resolution prior to submitting bids. Failura to visit the site and inspect existing
conditions shall not relieve any contractor from compliance with the construction documents claims for
additional work due 1o existing canditions will not be acceptable.

12. All required inspections shall be obtained by the contractors including final use and occupancy
permit

GENERAL STRUCTURAL NOTES

The fallowing apply unless shown otherwise on the plons—SEE STRUCTURAL See structural for design
parameters. Wind Load: 120 MPH, EXP C, Ground Show Loa 100 PR Seisme Zoner D

Comply with all provisions of the “International” codes as dopted by the State of Alasio. Indieations
regerding "Uniform” codes are for reference purposes only.
CRITERIA

1. Al materials, workmanship, design, and construction shall conform to the drawings, specificatians,
the 2009 IBC. Conform to all Chapter 16 and 23 requirements.

2. Contractor shall be responsble for all safety precautions and the methods, techniques sequences
or procedures required to perform the work.

3. Drawings indicate general and typical details of construction. Where conditions are not specmcuuy

indicated but are of simiar character to details shown, similar details of construction shall be used,
subject to review and approval by the orchitect and the structural engineer.

4. Wood framing lumber shall be kiln dried or MC—15, and graded and marked in conformance with
WCLB. standard grading rules for West Coast Lumber No. 16, latest edition, furnish to the following
minimum  standords:

Studs, Plotes & Miscellaneous light framing: Douglas Fir / Hem~Fir Standard Grade

Bolted Studs, Ledgers ond Plot Dougios Fir Stondard Grade

2 x 4 Studs ond Plotes  Douglas Fir / Hem—Fir Stondard Grade

5. Beoms ond headers DF /Hem Fir No.l or better.

GWB:  5/8" Type X

DRAWING SYMBOLS

©

O
+
-
e

doar syrbol

ot peint, slevatian

equpnent syanbol

ravicn, with clou

centenire, For unensiening

prapenty tine

new construction

damattion

Snake detector

@ Wurinated et slgn, =elf-powered
“Pernext HPA0-RED
or squal

PARTICIPANTS

TENANT

Oceon Beouty Seafoods

Cordova AK 99574
CONTRAGTOR

T80

ARCHITECT

STEPHEN PETERS ARCHITECTS
702 Water Street

Ketchikan, Aloska 99901

(907) 247-7077

(907) 247-7076 FAX
CIVIL/STRUCTURAL ENGINEER
R & M ENG.

365 Carlanna Loke Rd.

Ketchikan, Alaska 99901

(207) 225-7917

(907) 225-3441 FAX

ZONING INFORMATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION. Lot 2A, Block 2, Cordova Industrial Park, Plat75-565

SEE CODE ANALYSIS ALSO

DRAWING INDEX

A Prolect Location, Abbreviations, Drawing Symbols, General Notes, Gode Analysls

0.2 Architsctural Sits Plans
Plans-Schedules-Sectlons
Elevations

Detalls

Proieé\
Location

304 Seafood Lane
n Beauty Seafoo

|

Airport

=

|

E )
8o
35
; ON
N
53N
12
)
Riss

peters
3

i
spa

tect

ste|
arc|

1,
5.4,
79,

%

\[\4

oWy,
< O

©
x
[
i
<
3
>
5
°
2
5
o
o
c
@
3
=
5
5
o
E
5
<
o
®

Ocean Beauty Seafoods

Temp Housing

PROJECT LOCATION MAP

No Scale

%

40 of 96



96 J0 Ty

BYSE|Y 'BAOPIOD ‘OUBT J0Od WIF ¥OE
4ig W

LRy e Eh\m»ﬂmm%m x_u“ Pa— spoojeag Ajneag ueedQ
1005 siem 3ot eﬁa_sﬂsw m_.__wzo_._ QEO._.

AO0.1

" BELOW ASPHALT

2 1/2" BG/FND

: Rﬁ& WAY /E BOU

[e%

sooqgj

YA
&\ or O

BOUND

Set
BIhP

</ 82Ad

40,986 sq. ft.

LT0Z ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dVTNOTH NOISSINNOD ONINNV1d



96 J0 ¢v

B)SE|Y ‘BAOPIOD ‘SUBT J0Od WIF ¥OE
spoojeag Aineag ueadsQ

Buisnoy dwa|

eds _

w_s__uem 1
sJojed usljoals

41g W
Lyzy0 am

A0.2

Zis\\\\
AN

¥/
\
SITE PL
< \

L

& >
/HE RT/@ \
Z¥e = = v A/\
Ea = E < 4\
o Y /LW IO <
= roS W A
— VTT& O
(@D)] v = O <
o 07 Bagug
_
r= | X EVﬁMTMm
o Ld wld D reaoo=
8% = SAC%I
- . I
— =<
) L= r‘h
=< Z§ O
=
Ll O

LT0Z ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dVTNOTH NOISSINNOD ONINNV1d



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017

80" -0 &-0° 8-0 -0
/= £y s P /e £y 18" Dla. Conc, Sono ~Tube
R & i) B Fndtn. Pad-See Struct. for DTLS
Balh"ii:E Bat%g E Batqg E
— S S
@ @ @
8'x20" Carrugated
Steel Container/Typ. 3 Loc.s
ay M =1 P 7 = | NOTES-
hl ! Eﬁ =S | B | LEGEND 1) VERIFY/PROVIDE MECH/NATURAL VENT/EXHAUST FOR BATHS
! | ! ! | PER CODE TYP.
\@1 | — | @ | | 2) PROVIDE SOKE/CO DETECTORS PER CODE-TYP.
[ I I I I _
} ! ! ! } } FE| FIRE EXTINGUISHERIO LB TYFE ABC-4-A:80-B:C, MOUNT +44" AFF
. | | | | | | R, R EXIT/EMERGENCY PATHAAY LIGHTING
g | | [ | | | | Stor' o
E I | | | | T Upper
% | I | | | I Unit
Bunk: | | Bunk ! } Bunk | } Aoove/Ty
| | | | | |
| | | | | |
| | | | | |
[ | | | | |
| | | | | |
I | | | | |
| | | | | |
| — _ =" _ J
o — = .
Corruggted
Steel
Container
BEIGE
CORRUGATED
SIDIN'\(QEI:I% DOOR SCHEDULE
{ 2 Ly 4N 7Ly A 2 | g . Constructon Detais
= —/ \E s \Z ~/ > No. | & Size (WiH) Tk | door  frame [ v o | HOWR | Remarks
&[] A [30x68 134" | HM_| HM_| D1 - D-3 subled/WStrip/Thol/Lockset-Provirle 6x36 Lt @ Ext. Typ.
(TYPICAL UPPER-(3) (TYPICAL LOWER—(3)) D[ B [24'X6% 134" | HM_ | HM_ | D2 [ D2 | D3 hterior-Sider-Privacy Lock
Note: Exist. Prefab Doors/Hardware=Typ.
0 .
CONNEX UNITS - PLANS : o 2 NS
Tro [ 1 X DOOR TYPES
PROJECT NORTH
Typicol Roaf Construction:
Existing Membrane on Prefab
Mtl. Shell Constr.
N
Corrugated r
Steel
Container @
BEIGE
CORRUGATED
METAL A B
SIDING-TYP.
g
7 e WINDOW SCHEDULE
Corrugated Steel No. Size (WxH) Remarks QTY
Container—PreFabricated
z @\ @\ [ exepc [SLDER
Y 2 | - ) ‘ | |
/ "+ L |
T 1l ™ = ™ =
SN [ [ [ [ [
J L4d L—d E,J . L L—dJ
UNITS — SECTION . : i

D

dile 04T
e 042117

ketchikan, ak 98901
toh 807.247.7077
faxs 907.247.7076

702 water st.

st g
spa

U
o ‘Qi,'@'
s -,
=4 i ()
£< ?
- 4
Zs: 86\ 72
zs PHZ
%o\ ﬁs
Iis™ <N
e =
l'. * <

%

©
x
[7]
8
<
o
>
)
P
T 0o
D g©
E 5
w:
8653
>
25
Sa
Qo
£ 5°5
D 8
[}
=0

>
N

43 of 96



96 0 71

BYSE|Y 'BAOPJOD ‘GUET JOOd Wi 0§

vy W 2 3
i ] 1000 spoojesag Ajneag ueedQ 1
siayd __m__.uﬁm Buisnoy dwa| <C
a
w
E
3z 8
L
3,58
5200
23y L
££20 -
338¢ 1 =
By F—— g
. .
@ [
|
= b
3 -8
= =
%
< >
2 iy
o ()
. —
= 2 W
L e

I
T

N st /Fin. [Gdl
l ‘
i
|
|
L
|
1
| |
L
@1/4:\70

Approx| Exi

UB Elec. Service-Se= Givi
plnx Exist,
T

APl

BEIGE CORRUGATED
METAL SIDING

Corrugated Steel

Container

Service{See Civil

=
[} =
! < T =
| = =
| & fF——-<
| S =
[ —
_d - =
[
0-8 ol W.w
3500 = -
mmEm MV Sl
ashg 7\ O«
3589 - ol
TO2<2 £-90
o g
2 i
3 32
w
Q
w
m

LT0Z ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dVTNOTH NOISSINNOD ONINNV1d




PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017

3

—

Hanclrail
30-34"
FLOOR 1"
CONSTR.-SEE
STRUCT.\? y A
Aluminum B
Stringers—Typ.
IS
ace of Wall or
Guard Rail —
2" =
- 1=1/4-1-1/2"
F”A\um. Handrail Typ.
Alum. Handrail . .
— Return ounting Handrail
End to Wall or Post Typ-
ELAN SECTION
A TYP. HANDRAIL
! SCALE NTS

TYP. EXTERIOR STAIR SECTION

I(expan
CompositeTreads

metal) of

oY

~_/

7
MAX

-J%" Dia. Grip
Gal.Steel Hondrail
Ea.

22"

Gal. Steel Post
Typ. or Adj. Wall
Costr———

loo

Struct \

Side of Stair. Typ.

=Yg

dale 04T
e 042117

faxs 907.247.7076

gt g
spa

©
x
[7]
o
<
3
>
)
©
S
o
Q
@
g
©
-
n
[*]
[«]
o
E
£
<
[}
(-]

Ocean Beauty Seafoods

Temp Housing

>
&)

45 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

\ I \
f B !
| \ \
| | LOT 4 |
[
| |
w
4 BUNKHOUSE CONNECT TO EXISTING 1—1/4” GALVANIZED
STEEL WATER SERVICE IN BUNKHOUSE
| MECHANICAL ROOM
L 2 9
E u /
PP ! | 0
| © LOT 2A
M AV
| @ GRAVEL SURFACED DRIVEWAY CRAvEL . Q)
\ 4 .
‘ Z: THREE DOUBLE STACKED SERVICE
HOUSING UNITS — - " DIAMETER HDPE WATER
| ” = : g g NEW 17 DIAVETE N R
v ‘ W p— pumm—
© L= 63’ NEW 1" RECIRCULATING
| o ’ HOT WATER PIPES
WEL
‘ g }“ | GRA
| 5
| % ‘ NEW ELECTRION. CONDUIT
9 ! 3) 1-1/4" DIA. PVC
| . R PVC SEWER SERVICE
’ ! Nwszgzt D\AMgE 3 = s
w L S sS
| @ =
Z CONNECT TO EXISTING
‘ = ELECTRICAL PANEL _ — e —_— =
g o —
‘ o i
| . ol T_____
4 o (6) 60A UNFUSED DISCONNECTS | —_————— —_—
| S SINGLE POLE, EACH UNIT T T T T T e I
| , - | LOT 1-B
| 2]
3 |
| LOT 1-A ,
8 L,
| S |
| b !
P o |
‘ S ! ’ 2 2
w |
| B £
| »
' W A A
w |
| p | ,' ‘ D-1 PIPE BEDDING
ORAGE ’%‘:ﬂ
| ' CcoLb ST “ R pa] O(%O
; }
[ 4 | X
(2) 2" LAYERS NEW ELECTRICAL CONDUIT
| | ! ‘ IMLOLOK  FOAM &SN B
‘ ‘ | NEW 1" HDPE NEW 17 PEX_RECIRC.
4 | COLD WATER PIPES ~ HOT WATER PIPES ST,
w SeBALg My
‘ ! B, ey TRENCH SECTIONS £ S
I f? A9th A
2 - \ /4 £ lonsisioibanas
1 esigned: TSS_| Approved: 1SS Client: OCEAN BFAUTY Projoct: Shaet Deseription: <ot No. %’J%E‘:gksf;{‘jé@
— T fovn 755 [sooer 15 vomo et CORPONE, TEMP nHIQUP ING e
Descripfion I3 5 355 CARLANNA LAKE ROAD SITE PLAN C1
REVISION hecked: TSS_| Project No. 172328 KETGHIKAN, ALASKA 89501 P e

46 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017

cl
SEf
SEI

WATER MAIN

2-

SIDEWALK
FINISHED PAVED
| ROAD SURFACE =

I STAINLESS STEEL GUIDE RING W/ PIN AT \

VALVE FOR ALL SERVIGES BURIED 6 AND OVER
VALVE BOX j
RVICE VALVE

RVICE SADDLE

OCATE
.. VALVE BOX
T PROPERTY LINE

»or

AFTER ASSEMBLY & BEFORE BACKFILLING WRAP
6 MIL PVC SHEETING ARDUND SERVICE BOX

COPPER PPE —
12"x12"x3/4" PVC PLATE

COMPRESSION COUPLIN
SOMEERRBN S XM irenn

INCH x CLO;
SCH. 80 BRASS N‘PPLE CUNNECT TD EX\ST SERVICE FIPE W/ FITTINGS Ac
QUPLINGS EQ'D. WHERE EXIST LINE IS FERR SERVICE
METAL PROV\DE \NSULAT\NG COUPLING OR D\ELECTR\C UNION PIPE

NOTES:

L

. INSTALL TOP OF VALVE BOX IN SIDEWALK

1/4" BELOW TOP OF PAVED SURFACE.

ALLOW 12" FOR RAISING VALVE BOX.
ENLARGED BASE IS REQUIRED FOR 17 SERVICE
VALVES AND LARGER.

mTYP\CAL BURIED WATER SERVICE — 2” AND SMALLER

NOT TO SCALE

PROPERTY LINE

REMOVE EXISTING SEWER

INLAND 240 CLEANOUT LID 5 GROUND
MINIMUM 12" |.D. OPENING LEVEL
MARKED "SEWER™

MIXMJ 22.5° 4" €900 END CAP

BEND

NO INTRUSION
INTO MAIN

47 C900 PVC PIPE LATERAL

NOTES:

MINIMUM SLOPE OF .02 FT/FT

CONNECTIONS FROM ROOF DOWNSPOUTS, AREA
DRAINS, ETC. ARE PROHIBITED

TRENCH MUST BE DE-WATERED

PIPE MUST BE LAID ON AND BEDDED WITH
COMPACTED AND COMPETENT MATERIAL

MAIN

ENIE N

2\ SEWER LATERAL PROFILE

D1/ NOT TO SCALE

7SS

Approved:

Scale: AS NOTED | Date: 5—1—17

Descripfion 355 CARLANNA LAKE ROAD

REVISION hecked: TSS | Project No. 172328 KETCHIKAN, ALASKA 99801

TOP OF FINAL GRADE

2" AC PAVEMENT IN TRAVELED WAY
oF

JIM POOR AVENUE TRAFFIC AREAS NON—TREAFFIC AREAS

6” DEPTH OF 3/4” MINUS
CRUSHED D1 AGGRAGATE BASESE
COMPACTED TO 95% DF

MAX. DENSITY

=

BACKFILL MATERIAL SHALL CONTAIN

AFFIC AREAS. EXCAVATED
MATERIAL MAY BE USED AS BACKFILL
IF APPROVED BY THE ENGINEER.

4’ MINIMUM COVER
PAY
BURIED UTILITY WARNING TAPE LIMITS

COPPER TRACER WIRE
(WATER ONLY)

Tmﬂ@
»
7L

CROWN

6 / OF PIPE
O \ PIPE DIA

PER PLANS

PIPE BEDDING MATERIAL PLACED IN
6" LIFTS AND_COMPACTED TO 95% "
OF MAXIMUM DENSITY. <

~
ra 2" + PIPE 3
DIAMETER
NOTES (A):

1. BACKFILL MATERIAL SHALL BE PLACED IN 12" MAXIMUM LIFTS,

2. PIPE BEDDING MATERIAL MUST BE PLACED IN 6” MAX LIFTS BETWEEN COMPACTION.

3. TRENCH EXCAVATION AND SHORING SHALL COMPLY WITH LOCAL, STATE, AND OSHA REGULATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS.
INDICATED SLOPE IS FOR PAY QUANTITY DETERMINATION ONLY FOR IMPORTED BACKFILL GRAVEL AND RESURFACING
REQUIREMENTS.

4. IF UNSUITABLE PIPE FOUNDATION MATERIAL IS ENCOUNTERED DURING EXCAVATION, ENGINEER MAY DIRECT THE CONTRACTOR
TO OVER—EXCAVATE AND BACKFILL WITH SUITABLE MATERIAL.

5. THE DITCHLINE, IF ONE EXISTS, SHALL BE RESHAPED IN SUCH A MANNER TO ALLOW POSITIVE DRAINAGE TO MATCH
PRE—CONSTRUCTION CONDITIONS.

6. TRENCH SECTION APPLICABLE FOR BOTH SEWER, WATER PIPE AND STORM

NOTES (B):
1. INSULATION BOARD JOINTS SHALL BB T

BE LAPPED DEPTH OF COVER | INSULATION THICKNESS
2. MINMUM DEPTH OF COVER SHALL 470" OR GREATER | NONE REQUIRED

BE 3'-Q" UNLESS SHOWN OTHERWISE ’6" OR GREATER |2 INCHES

ON DRAWINGS OR PRIOR APPROVAL 30" OR GREATER | # INCHES

IS GRANTED FROM ENGINEER.

3. ALL IINSULATION SHALL BE DOW HI-60 EXTRUDED POLYSTYRENE (BLUE BOARD) OR APPROVED EQUAL.

m TYPICAL TRENCH DETAIL

NOT TO SCALE

REM ENG\NEER\NG KETCHIKAN, INC.

E
m:ggxg%mz.-&_
OCEAN BFAUTY Project: CORDOVA TEMP HOUSING Sheet Description: Sheet No. "-@i
07 2, BLOCK 2 CORDOVA INDUSTRIAL FARK h AN
DETAILS D1

47 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

AGENDA ITEM # 9¢
Planning Commission Meeting Date: 5/9/2017

PLANNING COMMISSION COMMUNICATION FORM

FROM: Planning Staff
DATE: 5/3/17
ITEM: Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision
NEXT STEP: Review Proposals and Provide Recommendation to City Council
INFORMATION
X MOTION
RESOLUTION

I. REQUEST OR ISSUE:

Requested Actions: Review proposals and give a recommendation to City Council
Disposal Property Address: Chase Avenue
Area: Lot 8 =8,334 SF; Lot 9 = 8,380 SF
Zoning: Low Density Residence District
Attachments: Proposal from Bradford, Campbell and Weise
Plat
Location Map

The request for proposals for this property began April 1%, 2017 and ended May 1%, 2017 at 10 AM. The
City received one proposal for the property. Attached is the full proposal packet and the proposal.

The proposed price from Bradford, Campbell and Weise was $3.30 per square foot for a total of $10,000

Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision
Page 1 of 8

48 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

In accordance with the Cordova Municipal Code, the Planning Commission will give a recommendation
to City Council on the proposal.

II.

RECOMMENDED ACTION / NEXT STEP:

Staff suggest the following motion:

“I move to recommend City Council approve the proposal from Bradford, Campbell and Weise for
portions of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision.”

I11.

FISCAL IMPACTS:

The city would receive purchase price of the property and future property tax revenue.

Iv.

BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

2/2/17 — Letter of interest received from Eagle Contracting (Attachment A).

2/14/17 — At the regular scheduled P&Z meeting the Planning Commission recommended disposing of the

lot by direct negotiation.
Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision

M/Bird S/Roemhildt to recommend to City Council to dispose of Lot 8 and 9. Block 1, Odiak Park
Subdivision as requested in the letter of interest from Eagle Contraction as outlined in Cordova
Municipal Code 5.22.060B by negotiating an agreement with Eagle Contracting to lease or purchase

the property.

Bird said she had wondered about the same questions raised by Bradford. Bird said it sounded like
the lot lines would have to be addressed. Greenwood said that a title search would clear it up and
costs would have to be negotiated. Roemhildt said that in the past they have not sold nearby land
because of the greenbelt issue. He said that disturbing the ground may affect the foundations of the
houses. Pegau said that the property was a steep cliff and he doesn’t see how it could be developed
and meet setbacks without a lot of rockwork.

Frohnapfel said he wanted to refer it back to staff to resolve the property line issue. He said it was
not up to the commission to determine whether or not someone could use the property; it was whether
or not the property is for sale. Greenwood said that the city does not have the funds to resolve the
issue and that typically the title search would be a part of the disposal process. Staff did not know the
issue existed until they received a letter of interest. In a typical land sale these sorts of title issues are
sorted out during closing. Stavig said that there is a substantial amount of land the city shows as
available that the city doesn’t even have title to yet. Greenwood pointed out that this was similar to
the Section Line easement they discovered on the Power Creek property; all of these issues get sorted
out during the disposal process, so that the costs for sorting the issues out can be a part of the
negotiations.

McGann said that you can’t do something on your property that adversely affects the neighbor’s

Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision

Page 2 of 8

49 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

property. He said that just because it is available does not obligate the commission to dispose of it.
Bird said that all of the properties along the hill were shown as available and that maybe they should
look at making all of the lots not available.

M/Bird S/Roemhildt to amend the motion to recommend to City Council to dispose of portions of
Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision as outlined in Cordova Municipal Code 5.22.060 by
requesting sealed proposals to lease or purchase the property.

Upon voice vote, amendment passed 5-0.
Yea: McGann, Pegau, Roemhildt, Frohnapfel, Bird
Absent: Baenen, Kocan

Upon voice vote, main motion passed 3-2.
Yea: McGann, Baenen, Roemhildt

Nay: Pegau, Frohnapfel

Absent: Baenen, Kocan

3/1/17 — At the regular scheduled City Council meeting council directed staff to put the property out for
proposals

N. New & Miscellaneous Business 16. Land disposal decision and method Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park
Subdivision

M/Hallquist S/Joyce to direct the City Manager to dispose of Lots 8 & 9 Block 1 Odiak Park
Subdivision as outlined in Cordova Municipal Code 5.22.060 B by requesting sealed proposals to
lease or purchase the property.

Hallquist said he drove by the lots today, he read the letters Council has received, he read what
planning and zoning recommended and he read the information that the City Clerk sent. He said we
listed this as available for sale — thinks it wouldn’t be right to pull it back then after someone send a
letter of interest on it. Hallquist said he read Tom McGann’s comments from the Planning and
Zoning meeting which say that you cannot do something on your own property that would adversely
affect your neighbor’s property so he is willing to take proposals on this lot and see what comes in.
Joyce agreed and said we should at least see what ideas are out there, including adjacent landowners
who are more than welcome to put proposals in. He said once the proposals are in, Council could opt
against choosing any one of them. Allison said he also thinks it never hurts to get proposals on a lot,
he said we are still at the beginning stages of this one. Bailer said he would support it but hopes staff
can stay close to this one, really understand what a contractor intends to do here before approving a
proposal.

Vote on the motion: 4 yeas, 0 nays, 2 absent (Burton, Beedle), 1 conflict of interest (Wiese). Motion
was approved.

5/1/17 — Proposal received from Bradford, Campbell and Weise
Applicable Code:

Section 5.22.060 — REVENUE AND FINANCE — DISPOSAL OF CITY REAL PROPERTY —

Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision
Page 3 of 8

50 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Methods of disposal for fair market value.

D. A request for proposals to lease or purchase city real property shall specify the criteria upon
which proposals will be evaluated and the minimum rent or purchase price. All proposals submitted
in response to a request for proposals shall be reviewed by the planning commission, which shall
make a recommendation to the city council to accept or decline any or all of the proposals. The city
council shall review the proposals and the planning commission's recommendation and accept or
decline any of the proposals.

V. LEGAL ISSUES:

Disposal documents may need legal review. Legal review may be required for the potential land conflict
described in section VL.

VI. CONFLICTS OR ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES:

After receiving the letter of interest, staff researched the property and discovered a possible conflict with the
property owners located northwest of Lot 8 and 9. Attachment B is the plat creating these two lots.
Attachment C shows the city’s parcel data with the two areas of conflict highlighted. Prior to disposal, this
issue will be investigated further and resolved.

VII. SUMMARY AND ALTERNATIVES:

The commission can choose to decline the proposal.

Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision
Page 4 of 8

51 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

ATTACHMENT A

EAGLE CONTRACTING CORPORATION

You've tried the rest now try the best.

RECEIVED
FEG 0 2200

City of Cordova 02/02/2017

City of Cordova
PO Box 1210
Cordova, AK 99574

RE: Per the City Land Disposal Map; Lots 8-9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision

To: Alan Lanning, City Manager
Rich Rogers, Public Works Director
Sam Greenwood, City Planner

| would like to express my interest in purchasing City Lots 8-9, Block 1, Odiak Park
Subdivision for future home development. Unfortunately, these lots have no
sewer main access and inadequate water service; however, | am prepared to
install these services.

Please contact me at your earliest convenience regarding this matter; either by
my cell phone, 907-429-7702, or email, ECC1@CTCAK.NET.

Sincerely,

o2

David L. Sjostedt
President

P.O.BOX 1128 + CORDOVA, ALASKA 99574 & (907)424-7702 e FAX (907) 424-3994

Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision
Page 5 of 8

52 of 96



96 J0 €S

8Jo 9 a3eq

PANS ed JBIPO ‘T YOI ‘6 PUL § 10T JO [esodsiq

UOISTIAT

"a

& & e

A wcndy coch s e sen 00 ey o e
ey .//..«:g,":‘f e

S G e nnmng
DEr renciees ant i wnsimie dhe ey e g
e

ro00iA%, -wf o
e

:“”e

EERTIEICATE 8 SEROENT 07 Sans s

# ncnge condite i o s o orepd
 Tecemace It ol3 cpsivat o

b o B il Povgrrs

LAEE

apesT s

e e

LEGAL FETTROFEION

e o

FERVEFORS CERTIEICATE

o Som ey 8 o
iy .r.lu gyt u,&.-:mnn.mm-w..--

i
%

e Stactee o e
wv, T ) ks SR
s s, R e i
e .u-sr, e e et e s
o e d, B sy it g A0

darane o Fied 0 &
VIS ITE, SR EE Foat e B4 e 0
e s e

i B a4 toking ke b SSARPLIIN Wo CATUETSsn £ mew septg .
" Sl A lion
4 e =
AT S E o S i
CEGAmE LOSATED (M $E |64 NI 14 SEC. 24, AHO SW
Srartus e e s e S i Mg e 4 e o g LTSN, B s e A dec. 28 ann aw g s
o . T
= =5 s 8 s o b, 5
e . e ares ar mar TRVCA, AVRLIN & AV ES
s B yhippbiigid
A R e
LAy T et A [t Neewmie 8 T
AT R 3 spnsae = [Gums e e
s ot o Goelrs | ROTARE._ I T i
.Mufﬁgg;u.arsjffglant e o S—

FLaT OF

ODIAK PARK SUBDIVIS! OoN

A REFUEY OF AMND.

4 INAJINHDVLLV

LT0C ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dV1NDO3TH NOISSININOD DNINNV1d



96 40 1S

8Jo L o3eq

UOISIAIPNS 3ed RIPO ‘T JO0IE ‘6 Pue § 107 JO [Bsodsiql

A = SR OTT FE

LTOZ ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dV1NDO3TH NOISSININOD DNINNV1d



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

ATTACHMENT C

Disposal of Lot 8 and 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision
Page 8 of 8

55 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Crry or Corpova

Request for Proposals (RFP) for Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision

The City of Cordova is requesting proposals for Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision. Lot 8 is
approximately 7,900 square feet and Lot 9 is approximately 6,900 square feet and both are zoned Low Density
Residential. Proposals are due May 1%, 2017 at 10 AM.

INFORMATION TO PROPOSERS

The fair market value for Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision is $3.30 per square foot and will be the minimum
price that will be accepted for the property. The total square footage is approximately 14,800 square feet. The exact square
footage will be determined by a survey of the property. If the successful proposal amount is greater than the minimum
price, the proposal amount shall be the amount paid.

All proposals shall include a deposit of $1,000.00. In the event that a proposer is not awarded the property, the city will
reimburse the deposit to the proposer. The deposit from the proposer awarded the property will be credited to costs
associated with the disposal, even if the disposal is not completed.

Prior to disposal, property will need to be surveyed, platted, and have corners marked. Proposer will be responsible for all
associated costs. Any water infrastructure on the property will have an easement placed on it.

The applicant shall also be responsible for all fees and costs the city incurred to third-parties in the transaction, including
without limitation costs of appraisal, attorney’s fees and costs, surveying and platting fees and costs, closing costs and
escrow fees as per CMC 5.22.100.

The attached Lease with Option to Purchase is a template for the agreement that will be negotiated with the proposer
that is awarded the property. The total proposed price will be used to determine the lease rate.

Proposers must comply with the provisions of the attached section of City Code for the Low Density Residence District.
Proposers will be required to connect to city water and sewer at their expense.

The city may issue addenda to this RFP. Addenda will be posted on the City Webpage with this RFP. It is the
responsibility of the proposer to ensure receipt of all addenda.

The city will consider all proposals for the property subject to any applicable laws and regulations, including
Chapter 5.22 of the Cordova Municipal Code (CMC).

The Planning Commission will review all submitted proposals. The Planning Commission will then make a
recommendation to the City Council. The City Council reserves the right to reject any proposal, part of any proposal, or
all proposals. The City Council may accept and negotiate with any proposer deemed most advantageous to the City of
Cordova.

For additional information or questions about the land disposal process, contact the City Planning Department at
424-6220, planning2@cityofcordova.net, or stop by in person.

56 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

ADDITIONAL REQUIRED INFORMATION

Please include with your proposal information that addresses the following items and any additional information
which you wish to provide.

L.

2.

Describe the proposed development in detail.

What is the proposed square footage of the development?

Provide a sketch, to scale, of the proposed development in relationship to the lot. (Attachment C)
Describe the benefit of the proposed development to the community.

What is the value of the proposed improvements (in dollars)?

What is your proposed timeline for development?

ATTACHMENTS

Attachment A: Criteria used when evaluating each submitted proposal.
Attachment B: A location map showing the subject property with a scale.
Attachment C: The property parcel with measurements.

Attachment D: Cordova Municipal Code — R Low Density Residence District
Attachment E: Sample Lease with Option to Purchase Agreement

57 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

SEALED PROPOSAL FORM

All proposals must be received by the Planning Department by Wednesday, May 1%, 2017 at 10 AM.

Property: Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision

Name of Proposer:

Name of Organization:

Address: Phone #:
Email:
Proposed Price Per Square Foot: § per square foot.
Proposed Square Footage Estimate (Provide Drawing): square feet.
SUBMITTAL OF PROPOSAL

Please mail proposals to:  City of Cordova
Attn: City Manager
C/O Proposals
P.O. Box 1210
Cordova, Alaska 99574

Or email proposals to citymanager@cityofcordova.net and planning2@cityofcordova.net. The email
subject line shall be “Proposal for Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision,” and the proposal shall
be attached to the email as a PDF file.

Or deliver your proposal to the front desk at City Hall.

Proposals received after Wednesday, May 15, 2017 at 10 AM will not be considered.

58 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT A

Each proposal will be evaluated on the criteria in the table below. Each criteria will be scored
from 1-10. The multiplier will then be applied to the scores to determine a final score.

Only criteria applicable to a residential zoning district will be used.

Final Land Disposal Evaluation Criteria

o Multiplier Proposal Rank Subtotal for
Criteria
1-10 Proposal
Value of improvements 1.75
Number of Employees 1
Sales Tax Revenue 1
Importance to Community 1.75
Syr Business Plan/Timeline 0.75
Enhanced Architectural 1.25
Design
Proposal Price 1.5
Consistency with 1
Comprehensive Plan
Total 10

59 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT B
: . - -
2= . o
= R -
<) ..*1-‘ ' =
n - ! 4 3
| E;j ' 1 S rge - &
E " g L
d q . — L
. _ ¥ "
LAKE AVENUE

"y

60 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT B

61 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT C

Feet

62 of 96




PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT D

Chapter 18.20 - R LOW DENSITY RESIDENCE DISTRICT

Sections:

18.20.010 - Permitted uses.

The following uses are permitted in the R low-density district:

A.
B.
C.

F.

One-family, two-family and three-family dwellings;
Boardinghouses;

Truck gardening, the raising of bush and tree crops, flower gardening, and the use of
greenhouses;

Home occupations;

Accessory buildings and uses not used or operated for gain and not including guest houses or
accessory living quarters;

Required off-street parking.

(Prior code § 15.204.1(A)).

18.20.020 - Building height limit.

The maximum building height in the R low density district shall be two and one-half stories but shall
not exceed thirty-five feet.

(Prior code § 15.204.1(B)).

18.20.030 - Lot area.

A. The minimum lot area in the R low-density district shall be four thousand square feet and the minimum
lot width shall be forty feet.

B. The minimum lot area in the R low density district for dwellings shall be:

1.
2.

For a one—family dwelling, four thousand square feet per dwelling unit.
For a two-family and three-family dwelling, two thousand square feet per dwelling unit.

(Prior code § 15.204.1(C)).

18.20.040 - Front yard.

There shall be a front yard in the R low density district of not less than ten feet from curb line.

(Prior code § 15.204.1(D)).

18.20.050 - Rear yard.

There shall be a rear yard in the R low density district of not less than twenty-five percent of the depth
of the lot, but such yard need not exceed fifteen feet.

Page 1

63 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT D

(Prior code § 15.204.1(F)).

18.20.060 - Side yard.
A. There shall be a side yard in the R low density district of not less than five feet. The minimum side
yard on the street side of a corner lot shall be ten feet.

B. The following additional requirements shall apply to two-family and three-family dwellings in the R low
density district:

In case the building is so located on the lot that the rear thereof abuts one side yard and front abuts
the other, the side yard along the rear of the building shall have a minimum width of twelve feet and the
side yard along the front of the building shall have a minimum width of eighteen feet.

(Prior code § 15.201.1(L)).

Page 2

64 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

Terms Highlighted in Yellow will be negotiated after award and other sections may be
considered in the negotiation process.

CITY OF CORDOVA
Cordova, Alaska

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE

This LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE (“Lease”) is made by and between
the CITY OF CORDOVA, a municipal corporation organized and existing under the laws
of the State of Alaska (the “City”), and XXXXXXX., an Alaska corporation (‘“Lessee”).

RECITALS

WHEREAS, the City owns that certain unimproved parcel of land in Cordova, Alaska
generally described as XXXXXX, located within Cordova Recording District, Cordova
Alaska, (referred to hereinafter as the "Premises");

WHEREAS, Lessee desires to lease the Property from the City (the “Premises”)
from the City and the City desires to lease the Premises to Lessee, on the terms and
conditions set forth herein;

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the Premises and the parties’ mutual
covenants, it is agreed as follows:

1. LEASE OF PREMISES

Subject to the terms and conditions set forth herein, the City leases to Lessee, and
Lessee leases from the City, the Premises, as described above and illustrated in Exhibit
A, attached and incorporated into this Lease.

2, LEASE TERM

The Lease Term will be (XX) years, commencing on , 20XX, (the
“Commencement Date”) and terminating at 11:59 p.m. on , 20XX, unless
earlier terminated in accordance with the terms of this Lease. The Lease does not provide
a lease renewal option.

3. RENT

A. Base Rent. The annual rent for the first ten years of the Lease Term will
be XXXX Hundred Dollars and nine cents ($XXXX) or XXX Dollars ($XXX) in twelve
monthly installments (“Base Rent”). Base Rent is due on the first day of each calendar
month during the Lease Term. Base Rent must be paid in lawful money of the United
States without abatement, deduction or set-off for any reason whatsoever, at the
address set forth in Section 22.E of this Lease, or at any other place the City directs in

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 1 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

65 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

writing. Base Rent shall be paid promptly when due without notice or demand therefore.
The parties intend the Base Rent to be absolutely net to the City. All costs, expenses,
and obligations of every kind and nature whatsoever in connection with or relating to the
Premises shall be the obligation of, and shall be paid by, Lessee.

B. Additional Charges. In addition to the Base Rent, Lessee acknowledges
and agrees that Lessee is obligated to pay and will pay, before delinquency and without
reimbursement, all costs, expenses, and obligations of every kind and nature whatsoever
in connection with or relating to the Premises or the activities conducted on the Premises,
including, without limitation, those costs, expenses, and obligations identified in Section
8 and all other sums, costs, expenses, taxes, and other payments that Lessee assumes
or agrees to pay under the provisions of this Lease (collectively the “Additional Charges”).

Without limiting in any way Lessee’s payment obligations, the City will have the
right, but not the obligation, at all times during the Lease Term, to pay any charges levied
or imposed upon the Premises that remain unpaid after they have become due and
payable, and that remain unpaid after reasonable written notice to Lessee. The amount
paid by the City, plus the City’s expenses, shall be Additional Charges due from Lessee
to the City, with interest thereon at the rate of ten percent (10%) per annum from the date
of payment thereof by the City until repayment thereof by Lessee.

C. Late Fee. Rent not paid within ten (10) days of the due date shall be
assessed a late charge of ten percent (10%) of the delinquent amount; the charge shall
be considered liquidated damages and shall be due and payable as Additional Charges.
In the event the late charge assessment above exceeds the maximum amount allowable
by law, the amount assessed will be adjusted to the maximum amount allowable by law.

D. Adjustment of Base Rent. Beginning on the tenth anniversary of the
Commencement Date, Base Rent shall be adjusted annually by the Consumer Price
Index (CPI-U) for the Anchorage, Alaska metropolitan area, as computed and published
by the United States Bureau of Labor Statistics. Annual Base Rent adjustments will be
equal to the percentage change between the then-current CPI-U and the CPI-U published
for the same month during the previous year, except the first Base Rent adjustment, which
will occur on the tenth anniversary of the Commencement Date, will be equal to the
percentage increase in the CPI-U from 2015 to the then-current year. No adjustments to
Base Rent shall cause a reduction in the Base Rent. The City is not required to give
advance written notice of the increase for the adjustment to be effective.

4. USES AND CONDITION OF PREMISES

A. Authorized Uses. The City and its authorized representatives and agents
shall have the right, but not the obligation, to enter the Premises at any reasonable time
to inspect the use and condition of the Premises; to serve, post, or keep posted any
notices required or allowed under the provisions of this Lease, including notices of non-
responsibility for liens; and to do any act or work necessary for the safety or preservation
of the Premises. Except in the event of an emergency, the City will give 48-hours’ advance
written notice of its intent to inspect the Premises. The City shall not be liable in any
manner for any inconvenience, disturbance, loss of business, nuisance, or other damage

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 2 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

66 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

arising out of the City’s entry onto the Premises, except for damage resulting directly from
the acts of the City or its authorized representatives or agents

B. Compliance with Laws. Lessee shall maintain and repair the Premises in
compliance with all applicable laws, regulations, ordinances, rules, orders, permits,
licenses, and other authorizations. Lessee shall not use or permit the use of the Premises
for any purpose prohibited by law or which would cause a cancellation of any insurance
policy covering the Premises. Lessee shall not cause or permit any Hazardous Material
(as defined in Section 10.B of this Lease) to be brought upon, kept, or used in, on, or
about the Premises except for such Hazardous Material as is necessary to conduct
Lessee’s authorized uses of the Premises. Any such Hazardous Material brought upon,
kept, or used in, on, or about the Premises shall be used, kept, stored, and disposed of
in a manner that complies with all environmental laws and regulations applicable to
Hazardous Material. Lessee shall not cause or allow the release or discharge of any other
materials or substances that are known to pose a hazard to the environment or human
health.

C. Lessee’s Acceptance of Premises. Lessee has inspected the Premises to
its complete satisfaction and is familiar with its condition, and the City makes no
representations or warranties with respect thereto, including, but not limited to, the
condition of the Premises or its suitability or fithess for any use Lessee may make of the
Premises. Lessee accepts the Premises AS IS, WHERE IS, WITH ALL FAULTS. No
action or inaction by the Council, the City Manager, or any other officer, agent, or
employee of the City relating to or in furtherance of the Lease or the Premises shall be
deemed to constitute an express or implied representation or warranty that the Premises,
or any part thereof, are suitable or usable for any specific purpose whatsoever. Any such
action or inaction shall be deemed to be and constitute performance of a discretionary
policy and planning function only, and shall be immune and give no right of action as
provided in Alaska Statute 9.65.070, or any amendment thereto..

5. DEVELOPMENT PLAN AND SUBSTANTIAL COMPLETION

A. Development Plan. The attached site development plan has been approved
by the Cordova City Council, and is attached to this Lease as Exhibit B. Any proposed
material change to the attached site development plan by Lessee will be treated as an
amendment to the Lease, requiring the written consent of both parties in accordance with
Section 22.B. The Lease does not confer any approval from the Cordova Planning
Commission regarding the site development plan or substitute for any approval process
required in Cordova Municipal Code. Rather it is Lessee’s responsibility to ensure the
site development plan complies with all city code requirements and procedures.

B. Substantial Completion. Lessee must substantially complete construction
of the project set forth in the site development plan attached as Exhibit B by
20XX, which is ten (10) years after the Lease’s Commencement Date. As used in thls
Lease, the term “substantially complete” shall mean the stage of construction when the
building(s), whose footprint is outlined in the site development plan, including its structure,
fagade, windows, roof, heating, and lighting, are sufficiently complete so that Lessee can

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 3 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

67 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

occupy and use the building and install or cause the installation of all equipment required
for the contemplated use thereof, and Lessee has provided to the City certificates of
inspection from certified inspectors providing that the above obligations have been met.
If Lessee fails to substantially complete the construction of the project set forth in the site
development plan by , 20XX, Lessee will be in default of this Lease and the
City may terminate the Lease and take any other action detailed in Section 13.

6. REPRESENTATIONS AND WARRANTIES

Lessee represents and warrants to the City that Lessee is not delinquent in the
payment of any obligation to the City, and that Lessee has not previously breached or
defaulted in the performance of a material contractual or legal obligation to the City, which
breach or default has not been remedied or cured.

7. ASSIGNMENTS AND SUBLETTING; SUBORDINATION

Lessee shall not assign or otherwise transfer this Lease or any interest herein or
sublet the Premises or any portion thereof, or permit the occupancy of any part of the
Premises by any other person or entity, without the prior written consent of the City, which
consent may be withheld in the City’s absolute discretion..

8. OPERATIONS, MAINTENANCE, UTILITIES, TAXES, & ASSESSMENTS

Lessee shall, at Lessee’s sole cost and expense, be solely responsible for:
(i) maintaining and repairing the Premises and shall not commit or allow any waste upon
the Premises; (ii) obtaining any and all permits and approvals necessary for Lessee’s use
of the Premises; (iii) all utilities and services needed for Lessee’s use of the Premises;
(iv) all taxes and assessments levied against the Premises, and Lessee agrees to pay all
such taxes and assessments when due, including, but not limited to, all utility bills and
special assessments levied and unpaid as of the Commencement Date or hereafter levied
for public improvements; (v) all licenses, excise fees, and occupation taxes with respect
to the business and activities conducted on the Premises; (vi) all real property taxes,
personal property taxes, and sales taxes related to the Premises or Lessee’s use or
occupancy thereof; and (vii) any taxes on the leasehold interest created under this Lease.

9. LIENS

Lessee will suffer no lien or other encumbrance to attach to the Premises,
including, without limitation, mechanic’s or materialman’s liens, sales tax liens under
Cordova Municipal Code 5.40.125, or property tax liens under Cordova Municipal
Code 5.36.260. If the City posts any notice of non-responsibility on the Premises, Lessee
will ensure that the notice is maintained in a conspicuous place.

10. INDEMNIFICATION

A. General Indemnification. Lessee shall defend, indemnify, and hold the City
and its authorized representatives, agents, officers, and employees harmless from and
against any and all actions, suits, claims, demands, penalties, fines, judgments, liabilities,

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 4 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

68 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

settlements, damages, or other costs or expenses (including, without limitation, attorneys’
fees, court costs, litigation expenses, and consultant and expert fees) resulting from,
arising out of, or related to Lessee’s occupation or use of the Premises or the occupation
or use of the Premises by Lessee’s employees, agents, servants, customers, contractors,
subcontractors, sub-lessees, or invitees, including, but not limited, to all claims and
demands arising out of any labor performed, materials furnished, or obligations incurred
in connection with any improvements, repairs, or alterations constructed or made on the
Premises and the cost of defending against such claims, including reasonable attorneys'
fees. In the event that such a lien is recorded against the Premises, Lessee shall, at
Lessee’s sole expense within ninety (90) days after being served with written notice
thereof, protect the City against said lien by filing a lien release bond or causing the
release of such lien.

B. Environmental Indemnification. The City makes no representation or
warranty regarding the presence or absence of any Hazardous Material (as hereafter
defined) on the Premises. Lessee releases the City and its authorized representatives,
agents, officers, and employees from any and all actions, suits, claims, demands,
penalties, fines, judgments, liabilities, settlements, damages, or other costs or expenses
(including, without limitation, attorneys’ fees, court costs, litigation expenses, and
consultant and expert fees) arising during or after the Lease Term, that result from the
use, keeping, storage, or disposal of Hazardous Material in, on, or about the Premises by
Lessee, or that arise out of or result from Lessee’s occupancy or use of the Premises or
the use or occupancy of the Premises by Lessee’s employees, agents, servants,
customers, contractors, subcontractors, sub-lessees, invitees (other than the City), or
authorized representatives. This release includes, without limitation, any and all costs
incurred due to any investigation of the Premises or any cleanup, removal, or restoration
mandated by a federal, state, or local agency or political subdivision, or by law or
regulation. Lessee agrees that it shall be fully liable for all costs and expenses related to
the use, storage, and disposal of Hazardous Material generated, kept, or brought on the
Premises by Lessee, its employees, agents, servants, customers, contractors,
subcontractors, sub-lessees, invitees, or authorized representatives.

Lessee shall defend, indemnify, and hold the City and its authorized
representatives, agents, officers, and employees harmless from and against any claims,
demands, penalties, fines, judgments, liabilities, settlements, damages, costs, or
expenses (including, without limitation, attorneys’ fees, court costs, litigation expenses,
and consultant and expert fees) of whatever kind or nature, known or unknown,
contingent or otherwise, arising in whole or in part from or in any way related to: (i) the
presence, disposal, release, or threatened release of any such Hazardous Material on or
from the Premises, soil, water, ground water, vegetation, buildings, personal property,
persons, animals, or otherwise; (ii) any personal injury or property damage arising out of
or related to such Hazardous Material; (iii) any lawsuit brought or threatened, settlement
reached, or government order relating to such Hazardous Material; and (iv) any violation
of any laws applicable to such Hazardous Material; provided, however, that the acts giving
rise to the claims, demands, penalties, fines, judgments, liabilities, settlements, damages,
costs, or expenses arise in whole or in part from the use of, operations on, or activities on

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 5 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

69 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

the Premises by Lessee or its employees, agents, servants, customers, contractors,
subcontractors, sub-lessees, invitees (other than the City), or authorized representatives.

As used in this Lease, “Hazardous Material” means any substance which is toxic,
ignitable, reactive, or corrosive or which is regulated by any federal, state, or local law or
regulation, as now in force or as may be amended from time to time, relating to the
protection of human health or the environment, as well as any judgments, orders,
injunctions, awards, decrees, covenants, conditions, or other restrictions or standards
relating to the same. “Hazardous Material” includes any and all material or substances
that are defined as “hazardous waste,” “extremely hazardous waste,” or a “hazardous
substance” under any law or regulation.

11. INSURANCE

Lessee shall procure and maintain, at Lessee’s sole cost and expense, the
following policies of insurance with a reputable insurance company or companies
satisfactory to the City:

A. Commercial General Liability. Commercial general liability insurance in
respect of the Premises and the conduct of Lessee’s business and operations, naming
the City as an additional insured, with minimum limits of liability of One Million Dollars
($1,000,000) per occurrence and Two Million Dollars ($2,000,000) aggregate;

B. Property Insurance. Property insurance, insuring against loss or damage
by fire and such other risks as are customarily included in the broad form of extended
coverage, in an amount of coverage not less than the replacement value of the
improvements on the Premises, if any, and on such commercially reasonable terms and
consistent with the customary commercial coverages in the city of Cordova,;

C. Personal Property Insurance. Personal property insurance covering
Lessee’s trade fixtures, furnishings, equipment, and other items of personal property, as
soon as such items are located on the Premises; and

D. Workers’ Compensation Insurance. Workers’ compensation insurance and
other insurance as required by law.

All insurance required under this Lease shall contain an endorsement requiring
thirty (30) days’ advance written notice to the City before cancellation or change in the
coverage, scope, or amount of any policy. Before commencement of the Lease Term,
Lessee shall provide the City with proof of the insurance required by this Section 11,
except where noted above.

12.  OWNERSHIP AND REMOVAL OF THE FACILITIES

Unless Lessee exercises its Option (defined in Section 21) (in which case all
improvements made be Lessee shall continue to be owned by Lessee), the facilities on
the Premises are and shall remain the property of Lessee until the expiration or earlier
termination of this Lease. Upon expiration or earlier termination of this Lease, at the

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 6 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

70 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

option of the City, title to and ownership of the facilities shall automatically pass to, vest
in, and belong to the City without further action on the part of either party other than the
City’s exercise of its option, and without cost or charge to the City. Lessee shall execute
and deliver such instruments to the City as the City may reasonably request to reflect the
termination of Lessee’s interest in this Lease and the facilities and the City’s title to and
ownership thereof.

But upon expiration or earlier termination of this Lease, Lessee shall remove from
the Premises, at Lessee’s sole expense, all of the facilities or the portion thereof that the
City designates must be removed. In such event, Lessee shall repair any damage to the
Premises caused by the removal and return the Premises as near as possible to its
original condition as existed on the Commencement Date. All facilities which are not
promptly removed by Lessee pursuant to the City’s request and in any event within thirty
(30) days of the date of expiration or termination of this Lease may be removed, sold,
destroyed or otherwise disposed of in any manner deemed appropriate by the City, all at
Lessee’s sole expense, and Lessee hereby agrees to pay the City for such expenses.

Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary in this Lease, all petroleum, fuel, or
chemical storage tanks installed in or on the Premises during the Lease Term will remain
Lessee’s property and upon expiration or earlier termination of this Lease, Lessee must
remove these items and all contaminated soil and other material from the Premises, at
Lessee’s sole expense.

13. DEFAULT AND REMEDIES

A. Default. The occurrence of any of the following shall constitute a default
and a breach of this Lease by the Lessee:

i. The failure to make payment when due of any Base Rent, Additional
Charges, or of any other sum herein specified to be paid by the Lessee if such failure is
not cured within ten (10) days after written notice has been given to Lessee;

ii. The failure to pay any taxes or assessments due from the Lessee to
the City and in any way related to this Lease, the Premises, any improvements, or the
Lessee’s activities or business conducted thereon, including, but not limited to, any real
property, personal property, or sales tax if such failure is not cured within thirty (30) days
after written notice has been given to Lessee;

iii. Lessee’s failure to substantially complete the site development plan,
as required by Section 5;

iv. An assignment for the benefit of Lessee’s creditors or the filing of a
voluntary or involuntary petition by or against Lessee under any law for the purpose of
adjudicating Lessee a bankrupt; or for extending the time for payment, adjustment, or
satisfaction of Lessee’s liabilities; or for reorganization, dissolution, or arrangement on
account of or to prevent bankruptcy or insolvency, unless the assignment or proceeding,
and all consequent orders, adjudications, custodies, and supervision are dismissed,

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 7 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

71 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

vacated, or otherwise permanently stated or terminated within thirty (30) days after the
assignment, filing, or other initial event;

V. The appointment of a receiver or a debtor-in-possession to take
possession of the Premises (or any portion thereof); Lessee’s interest in the leasehold
estate (or any portion thereof); or Lessee’s operations on the Premises (or any portion
thereof), by reason of Lessee’s insolvency;

Vi. The abandonment or vacation of the Premises continues for a period
of three (3) months of any consecutive four (4) month period during the Lease Term;
notwithstanding the foregoing, leaving the Premises vacant pending development of
improvements shall not be deemed abandonment;

Vii. Execution, levy, or attachment on Lessee’s interest in this Lease or
the Premises, or any portion thereof;

viii. The breach or violation of any statutes, laws, regulations, rules, or
ordinances of any kind applicable to Lessee’s use or occupancy of the Premises if such
breach or violation continues for a period of thirty (30) days or longer; or

iX. The failure to observe or perform any covenant, promise, agreement,
obligation, or condition set forth in this Lease, other than the payment of rent, if such
failure is not cured within thirty (30) days after written notice has been given to Lessee,
or if the default is of a nature that it cannot be cured within thirty (30) days, then a cure is
commenced within thirty (30) days and diligently prosecuted until completion, weather
and force majeure permitting. Notices given under this subsection shall specify the
alleged breach and the applicable Lease provision and demand that the Lessee perform
according to the terms of the Lease. No such notice shall be deemed a forfeiture or
termination of this Lease unless the City expressly elects so in the notice.

B. Remedies. If the Lessee breaches any provision of this Lease, in addition
to all other rights and remedies the City has at law or in equity, the City may do one or
more of the following:

i. Distrain for rent due any of Lessee’s personal property which comes
into the City’s possession. This remedy shall include the right of the City to dispose of
Lessee’s personal property in a commercially reasonable manner. Lessee agrees that
compliance with the procedures set forth in the Alaska Uniform Commercial Code with
respect to the sale of property shall be a commercially reasonable disposal;

ii. Re-enter the Premises, take possession thereof, and remove all
property from the Premises. The property may be removed and stored at Lessee’s
expense, all without service of notice or resort to legal process, which Lessee waives,
and without the City becoming liable for any damage that may result unless the loss or
damage is caused by the City’s negligence in the removal or storage of the property. No
re-entry by the City shall be deemed an acceptance of surrender of this Lease. No
provision of this Lease shall be construed as an assumption by the City of a duty to re-
enter and re-let the Premises upon Lessee’s default. If Lessee does not immediately

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 8 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

72 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

surrender possession of the Premises after termination by the City and upon demand by
the City, the City may forthwith enter into and upon and repossess the Premises with
process of law and without a breach of the peace and expel Lessee without being deemed
guilty in any manner of trespass and without prejudice to any remedies which might
otherwise be used for arrears of rent or breach of covenant;

iii. Declare this Lease terminated;

iv. Recover, whether this Lease is terminated or not, reasonable
attorneys’ fees and all other expenses incurred by the City by reason of the default or
breach by Lessee, less any rents received in mitigation of Tenant’s default (but City is not
under any duty to relet Premises);

V. Recover an amount to be due immediately upon breach equal to the
sum of all Base Rent, Additional Charges, and other payments for which Lessee is
obligated under the Lease;

Vi. Recover the costs of performing any duty of Lessee in this Lease; or

Vii. Collect any and all rents due or to become due from subtenants or
other occupants of the Premises

14. SUBSIDENCE

The City shall not be responsible for any washout, subsidence, avulsion, settling,
or reliction to the Premises or for any injury caused thereby to Lessee’s, any sub-lessee’s,
or any other person’s property. The City is not obligated to replace, refill, or improve any
part of the Premises during Lessee’s occupancy in the event of a washout, subsidence,
avulsion, settling, or reliction.

15. VACATION BY LESSEE

Upon the expiration or sooner termination of this Lease, Lessee shall peaceably
vacate the Premises and the Premises shall be returned to the City by Lessee together
with any alterations, additions, or improvements, unless the City requests that they be
removed from the Premises. Upon such vacation, Lessee shall remove from the
Premises any items of personal property brought on to the Premises. Any such property
not removed from the Premises within thirty (30) days of the expiration or termination of
this Lease shall become the property of the City at no cost or charge to the City, and may
be removed, sold, destroyed, or otherwise disposed of in any manner deemed
appropriate by the City, all at Lessee’s sole expense, and Lessee hereby agrees to pay
the City for these expenses.

16. RESERVATION OF RIGHTS

The City reserves the right to designate and grant rights-of-way and utility
easements across the Premises without compensating Lessee or any other party,
including the right of ingress and egress to and from the Premises for the construction,

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 9 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

73 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

operation, and maintenance of utilities and access, provided that Lessee shall be
compensated for the taking or destruction of any improvements on the Premises, and
provided further that the City’s designation will not unreasonably interfere with Lessee’s
improvements or use of the Premises. Lessee shall be responsible for requesting a rental
adjustment to reflect any reduction in the value of the Premises.

17. SIGNS

No signs or other advertising symbols, canopies, or awnings shall be attached to
or painted on or within the Premises without approval of the City Manager first being
obtained; provided, however, that this prohibition shall not apply to standard, directional,
informational and identification signs of two square feet or less in size. At the termination
of this Lease, or sooner, all such signs, advertising matter, symbols, canopies, or
awnings, attached or painted by Lessee shall be removed from the Premises by Lessee
at its own expense, and Lessee shall repair any damage or injury to the Premises, and
correct any unsightly conditions caused by the maintenance or removal of said signs.

18. HOLDING OVER

If Lessee, with the City’s written consent, remains in possession of the Premises
after the expiration or termination of the Lease for any cause, or after the date in any
notice given by the City to Lessee terminating this Lease, such holding over shall be
deemed a tenancy from month to month at the same Base Rent applicable immediately
prior to such expiration or termination, subject to adjustment in accordance with Cordova
Municipal Code 5.22.090.C, or such successor provision of the code then in effect, and
shall be terminable on thirty (30) days’ written notice given at any time by either party. All
other provisions of this Lease, except those pertaining to term, rent, and purchase option,
shall apply to the month-to-month tenancy. If Lessee holds over without the City’'s
express written consent, Lessee is deemed to be a tenant at sufferance and may be
removed through a forcible entry and detainer proceeding without service on Lessee of a
notice to quit.

19. EMINENT DOMAIN

If the whole or any part of the Premises shall be taken for any public or quasi-
public use, under any statute or by right of eminent domain or private purchase in lieu
thereof by a public body vested with the power of eminent domain, then the following
provisions shall be operative:

A. Total Taking. If the Premises are totally taken by condemnation, this Lease
shall terminate;

B. Partial Taking. If the Premises are partially taken by condemnation, then
this Lease shall continue and the rent as specified in Section 3 above shall be abated in
a proportion equal to the ratio that the portion of the Premises taken bears to the total
Premises leased hereunder; and

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 10 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

74 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

C. Award. Upon condemnation, the parties shall share in the award to the
extent that their interests, respectively, are depreciated, damaged, or destroyed by the
condemnation.

20. COSTS

Lessee shall be liable to and shall pay the City for the fees and costs incurred by
the City in connection with the negotiation, drafting, preparation, operation, and
enforcement of this Lease, including, without limitation, attorneys’ fees and costs incurred
by the City. All outstanding fees and costs shall be paid in full no later than the time of
the City’s execution of this Lease.

21. BUYER’S OPTION TO PURCHASE

A. Option. The City hereby grants to Lessee an option (the “Option”) to
purchase the Premises upon the terms and conditions stated in this Lease.

B. Option Period. The Option will commence upon the Commencement Date
of this Lease and terminate the date the Lease terminates (the “Option Period”). If Lessee
fails to exercise the Option during the Option Period, neither party shall have any further
rights or claims against the other party by reason of the Option.

C. Exercise of Option. To exercise the Option, Lessee must provide written
notice (“Notice of Exercise of Option”) to the City, delivered or mailed by certified or
registered mail, return receipt requested, to the City’s address set forth in Section 22.E,
at least sixty (60) days prior to the date Lessee intends to exercise the Option.

D. Conditions to Exercise Option. Lessee can only exercise the Option if all of
the following conditions are satisfied: (i) no default exists or is continuing under this Lease
and (ii) a the building as described in the site development plan attached as Exhibit B.is
substantially completed as defined in section 5 B

E. Purchase Price. Lessee shall have the right to purchase the Premises for
$XXXXX (“Purchase Price”) until the tenth anniversary of the Commencement Date. |If
Lessee exercises its Option to purchase the Premises after the tenth anniversary of the
Commencement Date, the Purchase Price will be adjusted to the current fair market
value, as reasonably determined by the City, excluding all improvements completed by
Lessee under this Lease. In the event that Lessee exercises the Option on or before
, 7 years 20XX, payment due at Closing to the City (“Closing Payment”)
will equal the Purchase Price reduced by all Base Rent payments paid by Lessee to the
City under this Lease. In the event that Lessee exercises the Option after
, 7 years 20XX, the Closing Payment will equal the Purchase Price, and
the Closing Payment will not be reduced by any Base Rent payments paid by Lessee to
the City under this Lease.

F. Closing Date. The Closing must occur on a date (the “Closing Date”)
mutually agreed upon by the parties, but must be within sixty (60) days after the exercise
of the Option.

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 11 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

75 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

G. Closing. At Closing, the City shall deliver a quitclaim deed, subject to
matters of record, including those matters that have arisen out of Lessee’s use and
occupancy of the Premises, in recordable form, transferring marketable title (subject to
Lessee’s reasonable approval) and Lessee shall execute and deliver to the City the
Closing Payment in full, in immediately available funds. This Lease will terminate upon
the Closing of Lessee’s purchase of the Premises. All costs and fees (including attorneys’
fees) associated with the negotiation, drafting, preparation, and enforcement of a
purchase and sale agreement and related documents, the closing of the transaction, and
the termination of the leasehold interest in the Premises, including, but not limited to,
environmental assessments, appraisal fees, escrow fees, recording fees, and title
insurance, will be paid by Lessee.

H. Cooperation for Consummating the Option. If Lessee exercises the Option,
the City and Lessee each covenant and agree to sign, execute, and deliver, or cause to
be signed, executed, and delivered, and to do or make, or cause to be done or made,
upon the written request of the other party, any and all agreements, instruments, papers,
deeds, acts, or things, supplemental, confirmatory, or otherwise, as may be reasonably
required by either party hereto for the purpose of or in connection with consummating the
Option.

l. City’s Right of First Refusal. In the event Lessee exercises its Option and
subsequently determines to sell or otherwise dispose of the Premises, the City shall have
a continuous and exclusive right of first refusal to purchase the Premises. The parties
must either include notice of the City’s right of first refusal in the deed transferring the
Premises to the Lessee, or execute a separate document acceptable to the City and in a
recordable form ensuring the City’s right of first refusal hereunder. The document must
be recorded contemporaneously with the recording of the deed. The City’s right of first
refusal to purchase the Premises contains the following terms and conditions:

i. Lessee may accept an offer for the sale or other disposition of the
Premises only if it is made subject to the City’s right of first refusal herein. Upon
acceptance of an offer for the sale, disposition, conveyance, or transfer from a third party
(the “Purchase Offer”), Lessee will present a copy of the Purchase Offer and acceptance
to the City by written notice at the address set forth in Section 22.E. The City will then
have sixty (60) days to either agree to purchase the Premises on the same terms and
conditions set forth in the Purchase Offer, or decline to exercise its right of first refusal.
The City shall give written notice of its decision to exercise or decline to exercise its right
of first refusal to Lessee at the address set forth in Section 22.E no later than sixty (60)
days after being presented with a copy of the Purchase Offer.

i. If the City declines to exercise its right of first refusal, Lessee may
then sell or otherwise dispose of the Premises to the third party on the same terms and
conditions set forth in the Purchase Offer. If the sale or other disposition is completed on
the same terms and conditions set forth in the Purchase Offer, then any interest of the
City in and to the Premises shall cease and be of no further force and effect and the City
shall provide in recordable form a release of its right of first refusal at the closing of the
sale to the third party. If the sale or other disposition is not completed on the terms and

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 12 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

76 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

conditions in the Purchase Offer, then the City will continue to have its exclusive right of
first refusal under the procedures outlined above in this Section, before Lessee may
convey or transfer its interest in the Premises to a third party.

22. MISCELLANEOUS

A. Time Is of the Essence. Time is of the essence for this Lease and of each
provision hereof.

B. Entire Agreement. This Lease represents the entire agreement between
the parties with respect to the subject matter hereof, and may not be amended except in
writing executed by the City and Lessee.

C. Governing Law and Venue. This Lease shall be subject to the provisions of
the Cordova Municipal Code now or hereafter in effect. This Lease shall be governed by
and construed in accordance with Alaska law and any action arising under this Lease
shall be brought in a court of competent jurisdiction in Cordova, Alaska.

D. Relationship of Parties. Nothing in this Lease shall be deemed or construed
to create the relationship of principal and agent, partnership, joint venture, or of any
association between Lessee and the City. Neither the method of computation of rent, nor
any other provisions contained in this Lease, nor any acts of the parties shall be deemed
to create any relationship between the City and Lessee other than the relationship of
lessee and lessor.

E. Notice. All notices hereunder may be hand-delivered or mailed. If mailed,
they shall be sent by certified or registered mail to the following respective addresses:

TO CITY:

City of Cordova

Attn: City Manager
P.O. Box 1210
Cordova, Alaska 99574

TO LESSEE:

XXXXX
P.O. Box XXXX
Cordova, Alaska 99574

or to such other address as either party hereto may from time to time designate in
advance in writing to the other party. Notices sent by mail shall be deemed to have been
given when properly mailed. The postmark affixed by the U.S. Post Office shall be
conclusive evidence of the date of mailing. If hand-delivered, notice shall be deemed to
have been made at the time of delivery.

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 13 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

77 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E
F. Captions. Captions herein are for convenience and reference and shall not

be used in construing the provisions of this Lease.

G. No Waiver of Breach. No failure by the City to insist upon the strict
performance of any term, covenant, or condition of this Lease, or to exercise any right or
remedy upon a breach thereof, shall constitute a waiver of any such breach or of such
term, covenant, or condition. No waiver of any breach shall effect or alter this Lease, but
each and every term, covenant, and condition of this Lease shall continue in full force and
effect with respect to any other existing or subsequent breach.

H. Survival. No expiration or termination of this Lease shall expire or terminate
any liability or obligation to perform which arose prior to the termination or expiration.

l. Partial Invalidity. If any provision of this Lease is held by a court of
competent jurisdiction to be invalid, void, or unenforceable, the remainder of the
provisions shall remain in full force and effect and shall in no way be affected, impaired,
or invalidated.

J. Successors and Assigns. The terms, covenants, and conditions in this
Lease shall inure to the benefit of and shall be binding upon the successors and permitted
assigns of the City and Lessee.

K. Estoppel Certificates. Either party shall at any time and from time to time,
upon not less than ten (10) days’ prior written request by the other party, execute,
acknowledge, and deliver to such party a statement certifying that this Lease has not
been amended and is in full force and effect (or, if there has been an amendment, that
the same is in full force and effect as amended and stating the amendments); there are
no defaults existing (or, if there is any claimed default, stating the nature and extent
thereof); and stating the dates up to which the Base Rent and Additional Charges have
been paid in advance.

L. Recordation of Lease. The parties agree that this Lease shall not be
recorded, but upon the request of either party, the other party will join the requesting party
in executing a memorandum of lease in a form suitable for recording, and each party
agrees that such memorandum shall be prepared and recorded at the requesting party’s
expense.

M. Authority. Lessee represents that it has all necessary power and is duly
authorized to enter into this Lease and carry out the obligations of Lessee. Lessee further
represents that Lessee has the necessary power to authorize and direct the officer of
Lessee whose name and signature appear at the end of this Lease to execute the Lease
on Lessee’s behalf.

N. Exhibits. Exhibits A and B to this Lease are specifically incorporated into
the Lease.
LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 14 of 16

F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

78 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

0. No Third-Party Beneficiaries. Nothing in this Lease shall be interpreted or
construed to create any rights or benefits to any parties not signatories, successors, or
permitted assigns of signatories to this Lease.

P. Interpretation. The language in all parts of this Lease shall in all cases be
simply construed according to its fair meaning and not for or against the City or Lessee
as both City and Lessee have had the assistance of attorneys in drafting and reviewing
this Lease.

Q. Counterparts. This Lease may be executed in counterparts, each of which
when so executed and delivered shall be deemed to be an original and all of which taken
together shall constitute one and the same instrument.

R. Attorneys’ Fees. In the event that any suit or action is brought to enforce
this Lease or any term or provision hereof, the parties agree that the prevailing party shall
recover all attorneys’ fees, costs, and expenses incurred in connection with such suit or
action to the maximum extent allowed by law.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have caused this Lease to be executed as
of the Commencement Date.

CITY: CITY OF CORDOVA

By:

Its:

LESSEE: XXXX

By:

Its:

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE Page 15 of 16
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

79 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
ATTACHMENT E

Exhibit A

Legal Description

Exhibit B

Development Plan

LEASE WITH OPTION TO PURCHASE - EXHIBIT B Page 1 of 1
F:\401777\222\00427326.DOCX

80 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

RFP for Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision
City of Cordova
Cordova, Alaska

Date: 5/1/17 Time: 10:00AM

Location:  City Hall

PRESENT: !,a_;(: S¥me‘3‘¥M&<DW\m N Bc&r(o (UUD (DC/(

__ proposal(S) RECEIVED:

Name: AMOUNT:

W ?)m\&%w\ - m@w 2 ,5Dr6%-@(

AN
Wi’rnef/ 7

| Ay

vxéif‘r’wes’é 4

h_%féiﬂulklfbﬁﬂh

Witness

81 of 96




PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

SEALED PROPOSAL FORM

All proposals must be received by the Planning Department by Wednesday, May 1%, 2017 at 10 AM.

Property: Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision

Name of Proposer: Wiese, Bradford | Co\wp e\
Name of Organization:  Raul¥ 00d Rowd  (esiderts
Address:  Bpa 10 Phone#: 124 - Seb
Covdovey, AL cASTY Email: Wi se fam € Cteald, net
BretBroddb @ all. net

QopSsup € lnotroail . tom

Proposed Price Per Square Foot: § 3,30 per square foot.

Proposed Square Footage Estimate (Provide Drawing): |9, 000 square feet. ooy~ 2 J\%)Ju-mo\

SUBMITTAL OF PROPOSAL ’

Please mail propoesals to:  City of Cordova
Attn: City Manager

C/O Proposals
P.O.Box 1210
Cordova, Alaska 99574

Or email proposals to citymanager@cityofcordova.net and planning2@cityofcordova.net. The email

subject line shall be “Propeosal for Lots 8 & 9, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision,” and the proposal shall
be attached to the email as a PDF file.

Or deliver your proposal to the front desk at City Hall.

Proposals received after Wednesday, May 1%, 2017 at 10 AM will not be considered.

82 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

25 April 2017
Land Sale Proposal for Lot 8, Block 1, Odiak Park Subdivision

We, Max and Cecilia Wiese, Bret and Cindy Bradford, and Bruce and Sally Campbell, propose to purchase
Lots 8 and 9 of Odiak Subdivision from the city of Cordova.

Lots 8 and 9 border the southeast property line of all of our lots. We propose to survey and replatt Lot 9
and Lot 8, lot 8 being divided into two equal lots, lot 9 left intact, preserving the greenbelt area along
Chase Avenue as described in previous, individual land sales between the city of Cordova and Ardy
Hansen and the city and John Mallory. Once the lots are surveyed and replatted, we would like to
purchase the lots through individual, direct negotiation with the city.

With the survey and replatting, we would like to straighten the lot lines, determine easement allocations
for the water line on each of the lots, sharing the costs with the city to help determine the actual land
available for purchase and easement necessary for water line access.

We intend to conserve the greenbelt area as required by the city and not disturb the coherent landscape
of the cliff area, continuing to provide valuable wind protection to our historic homes, stability to the
steeply slanted terrain and provide suitable habitat to support the wildlife residents in the area.

The greenbelt also acts as a sound barrier and buffer from highway traffic noise, maintaining the
neighborhood atmosphere, much in demand in our city.

As shown in the sketch and after reserving space for the greenbelt and water line easement, the area on
both lots 8 and 9 appear to be about 50 feet by 100 feet or 5,000 square feet each. With the acquisition
of the property, this proposal will result in increased property values to our lots plus maintain property
values of those in the Railroad Row neighborhood resulting in consistently increasing tax revenues for
the city.

Though small in area on which to develop, we will sincerely look forward to being able to continue
maintaining the area in front of our homes, now with the possibility of adding a storage building, small
gazebo or greenhouse to add to our current gardening endeavors.

Considering the value per square foot the city has listed for the property, we feel the value of our
proposal could be anywhere from $33,000 - $40,260.

The timeline is understood to be within a period of time, determined by the time needed to contract
with a qualified surveyor, completion of the survey and replatting into the proposed 3 lots and the
arrangements for funding and payments to the city, or up to one year, to provide a timeline for the
unknowns.

Thank you for your time and consideration of our proposal.

VTV

83 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

ATTACHMENT C

S50 X (b
e 50(1):_{1‘37’

CEERE

8D
(ZO)
3
(12)
50x)10D
~ 5000 551/#
Q %3.50
N|{]o 15 30 60
(S
A Feet

84 of 96


planner2
Snapshot


PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

AGENDA ITEM # 10a
Planning Commission Meeting Date: 5/9/2017

PLANNING COMMISSION COMMUNICATION FORM

FROM: Planning Staff

DATE: 5/3/17

ITEM: Title 16 Building Code Discussion
NEXT STEP: Ordinance format

_ X__ INFORMATION
MOTION
RESOLUTION

I. REQUEST OR ISSUE:

Attached is the new version of Title 16 Building Codes. No edits have been made to Chapters 16.80 Mobile
Home Parks and 16.90 Trailers and Trailer Camps. The end product will be an ordinance repealing Chapter
16.05 through Chapter 16.75 and replacing them with the attached document. Chapters 16.80 and 16.90 will
remain as codified now.

II. RECOMMENDED ACTION / NEXT STEP:

The commission should review the attached document and come to the meeting with comments, concerns
or edits.

Staff is developing a list of chapters and sections located in different titles, such as Title 18 and Title 1,
which will need to be edited due to the changes in Title 16. Staff will develop a draft ordinance for review
by the city attorney. After attorney review, the final step for the commission would be to recommend the

Title 16 Building Code Discussion
Page 1 of 2

85 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

ordinance to city council.

III.  FISCAL IMPACTS:

None at this step. The City Manager will determine when legal expenses can be incurred.

IV.  BACKGROUND INFORMATION:

This is the continuation of the Title 16 Building Code rewrite.

V. LEGAL ISSUES:

Unknown

VI. CONFLICTS OR ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES:

N/A

VII. SUMMARY AND ALTERNATIVES:

N?A

Title 16 Building Code Discussion
Page 2 of 2

86 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Chapter 16.10 - BUILDING REGULATION
16.10.010 - Adoption of codes.

16.10.015 - Copies on file.

Chapter 16.15 - BUILDING CODE ADMINISTRATION
16.15.015 - Building Code—Modifications.
16.15.020 - Building Code—Disclaimers.
16.15.025 - Building permit required.

16.15.030 - Building Official

16.15.035 - Work exempt from permit.

16.15.040 - Building Code—Appeals.

16.15.045 - Building permit fees.

16.15.050 - Stop work order.

16.15.055 — Violations.
Chapter 16.20 — INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE
Chapter 16.30 — INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

87 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017
Chapter 16.10 - BUILDING REGULATION
16.10.010 - Adoption of codes.
The city adopts by reference the following codes:

A. 2009 International Building Code, or current adopted state code, as amended by the state, for all
buildings except one- and two-family dwellings and residential accessory buildings.

B. 2012 International Residential Code.
C. 1997 Uniform Code for Abatement of Dangerous Buildings.

Although not published in full in this section, all the provisions of these codes shall be and are
adopted by reference to the same extent as if set forth in full herein, except to the extent that they
shall be in conflict with this code or any relevant ordinance later adopted in which case the
provisions of this code and later ordinances shall prevail.

16.10.015 - Copies on file.

One copy of each code of technical regulation adopted by reference in Section 16.05.010 shall be
kept in the office of the clerk.

Chapter 16.15 - BUILDING CODE ADMINISTRATION
16.15.015 - Building Code—Modifications.

The city council shall have power to modify the provisions of the Building Codes adopted by this
title.

16.15.020 - Building Code—Disclaimers.

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this chapter is, for any reason, held to be
unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this
chapter. The city council hereby declares that it would have passed the ordinance codified in this
chapter, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one
or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

16.15.025 - Building permit required. - Delete 18.76.070 Building Permit. Needs to be added to 1.28 as
violation; Delete 16.17 Site Plan

A building permit shall be required for the erection, construction, establishment, moving,
alteration, enlargement, repair or conversion of any building or structure in any district established
by this title, subject to the following provisions:

A. Application for a building permit shall be filed with the building official on a form approved

by him. If the application meets the requirements of this title and any other applicable
regulations, the building official will issue a building permit.

88 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

B. In all cases where the planning commission or the board of adjustment has allowed a variance
or an exception, the building official shall issue a building permit sufficient to allow such
building or work to be done in accordance with that decision; provided, that no permit shall be
issued pursuant to any decision until the time for rehearing or for appeal shall have expired and
then only in the event that no appeal or application for rehearing shall have been filed within
such time.

C. No building permit shall be issued by the building official without a coincident application for
zoning compliance. Any permit issued in conflict with the zoning title shall be null and void.

D. The building permit or copy of it shall be displayed at the work site until completion of the
project.

E. It shall be the duty of every person who performs work for the installation or repair of a
building or structure for which this title refers to, to comply with the codes.

F. The issuance or granting of a building permit or approval of plans or specifications under the
authority of the Building Code shall not be deemed or construed to be a permit for or an
approval of any violation of any of the provisions of this title or any amendment thereto. No
permit presuming to give authority to violate or cancel any of the provisions of this title shall
be valid except insofar as the work or use which is authorized is lawful and permitted.
18.80.020 - Building permit—Scope and validity. Delete adding here-18.80 do we need
this in zoning as well?

16.15.030 — Building Official.

The building official shall be the officer charged with the administration and enforcement of this
title. The public works director shall act as building official unless the City Manager otherwise
designates.

16.15.035 - Work exempt from permit.

Exemptions from permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant authorization for
any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of the code of any other laws or
ordinances. Permits shall not be required for the following:

A. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet.

16.15.040 - Building Code—Appeals.
Whenever the building official shall disapprove an application or refuse to grant a permit applied
for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the code do not apply or that the true intent and
meaning of the code has been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the applicant may appeal the
decision of the building official in the manner set forth in Section 18.64.040. Appeals of the
Planning Commission shall be conducted in the manner set forth in Section 18.64.030.

16.15.045 - Building permit fees.

A. Fees shall be established by resolution of the city council.

89 of 96



B.

PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Where work for which a permit is required by this chapter is started or proceeded with prior to
obtaining such permit, the fees specified by resolution shall be doubled.

16.15.050 - Stop work order.

A.

Upon notice from the building official that work on any building or structure is being
performed contrary to the provisions of this code or in an unsafe and dangerous manner, such
work shall be immediately stopped. The stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given
to the owner of the property involved, or to the owner's agent or to the person doing the work
and shall state the conditions under which work will be permitted to resume.

. Unlawful continuance. Any person who shall continue any work in or about the structure after

having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed
by law.

16.15.055 — Violations.

Failure to obey or comply with any provision of this title or any rule, order or regulation issued
thereunder is a violation. The minimum penalty upon conviction of a single violation of this
chapter is specified in Chapter 1.28.

Chapter 16.20 — INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

The following amendments are made to the International Building Code, 2009 Edition (references
are to section numbers in the International Building Code):

A.

Section 1609.3 Basic wind speed, is amended by adding the following:

The basic wind speed in MPH, for the determination of the wind loads shall be 110 MPH.

Chapter 16.30 - INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE

The following amendments are made to the International Residential Code, 2012 Edition
(references are to section numbers in the International Residential Code):

A.

R101.1, Title, is amended to read as follows:

This code shall be known as the 2012 International Residential Code (IRC) with amendments
and shall be cited as such. It is referred to herein as 'the code'.

. R101.2, Scope, is amended to read as follows:

The 2012 IRC with Amendments shall be the referenced code for residential structures
containing three or fewer dwellings and townhouses not more than three stories above grade
plane in height and their accessory structures.

. Part 2, Administration and Enforcement, is deleted.

90 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

D. Table R301.2(1), Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria, is amended to read as follows:

GROUND SNOW LOAD 100 Ibs. per sq. foot
Speed (mph) 110 miles per hour
WIND DESIGN Topographic Effects | No
SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY D2
Weathering Severe
SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM | Frost Line Depth 24”
Termite No
WINTER DESIGN TEMP 1°F
ICE BARRIER UNDERLAYMENT REQUIRED Yes
FLOOD HAZARDS 2015 FIRM and FIS
AIR FREEZING INDEX 2500
MEAN ANNUAL TEMP

. R302.2, Townhouses, is amended in the exception, to add at the beginning of the paragraph:
If the building is not constructed utilizing a fire-suppression system, a common 2 hour fire-
resistance-rated wall shall be used. If it is constructed with an approved fire-suppression
system...

. R303.3, Bathrooms, is amended to read as follows, with the exception deleted:

Bathrooms, water closet compartments and other similar rooms shall be provided with exhaust
ventilation in accordance with the requirements of ANSI/ASHRAE 62.2-2010 as amended in
R403.5 of the 2012 Building Energy Efficiency Standard and per manufacturer requirements.

. R303.4, Mechanical ventilation, is amended to read as follows:

Whole-house and spot ventilation shall be installed per the requirements of ANSI/ASHRAE
62.2-2010 as amended in R403.5 of the 2012 Building Energy Efficiency Standard (chapter 11
of the code with Alaska-specific amendments).

. R303.5.1. Intake openings, is amended to read as follows:

Add to the last sentence of the first paragraph:

... and 3 feet horizontally from the contaminant source.

Delete the second paragraph and replace it with:

All mechanical ventilation shall be in accordance with ANSI/ASHRAE 62.2-2010 as
amended in R403.5 of the 2012 Building Energy Efficiency Standard (chapter 11 of the code

with Alaska-specific Amendments).

R309.5, Fire sprinklers, is amended so the first sentence reads as follows:

91 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

Private garages shall be protected by fire sprinklers where required by the Department of
Public Safety and/or where the garage wall has been designed based on Table R302.1(2)
Footnote a.

R310.2.2, Window well drainage, is amended to add the following sentence prior to the
exception:

Window wells shall be designed to minimize the potential of the well becoming filled with
snow and/or standing water which impedes operation of the egress fenestration.

. R313, Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems, is amended to read as follows:

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. If installed, automatic residential fire
sprinkler systems for townhouses shall be designed and installed in accordance with Section
P2904.

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems. If installed, automatic
residential fire sprinkler systems for one- and two-family dwelling units shall be designed and
installed in accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13D.

. R317.1, Location required, is amended to delete “naturally durable wood or” from the first
sentence.

. R501.3, Fire protection of floors, is amended to modify exception 2 to read:

Floor assemblies located directly over a crawl space containing a direct-vent, sealed
combustion appliance with forced draft exhaust; combustion air intake must terminate to the
building exterior. Application of this exception requires installation of a smoke alarm in the
crawl space in accordance with the requirements of Section R314 Smoke Alarms, with the
exception of R314.3 Location, and a carbon monoxide alarm in accordance with the

requirements of Section R315 Carbon Monoxide Alarms.

. R703.2, Water-resistive barrier, is amended to add the following at the beginning of the
sentence:

When installed or required by the manufacturer...
. R703.3.1, Panel siding, is amended to add the following to the end of the paragraph:

Exterior type plywood siding with a grooved pattern shall not be installed horizontally and
used as the weather resistant siding.

. R806.1, Ventilation required, is amended to add the following to the beginning of the first
sentence and to delete the exception:

When located outside of the building thermal envelope...

. Table R806.5, Insulation for Condensation Control, is replaced with the following table:

92 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING

MAY 9, 2017
Table R-A806.5
Insulation for Condensation Control
Air-Permeable Insulation R-Value Minimum Air-Impermeable Insulation R-Value?
R-15 R-30
R-19 R-38
R-21 R-42
R-25 R-50
R-30 R-60
R-38 R-76
R-N 2*(R-N)®
*Installed on the warm-in-winter side *Installed on the cold-in-winter side
a. Contributes to but doesn’t not superseded the requirements in Section N1102.
b. Air-Impermeable Insulation R-Value shall equal, at minimum, twice the R-value of
the Air Permeable insulation.

. R807.1, Attic access, is amended to add the following to the end of the paragraph:
Attic access shall not be located in a room containing one or more fixtures in the Bathroom
Group. Access may be located in closets with minimum depth of 23 inches and minimum
width of 48 inches.

. Chapter 11, Energy Efficiency, is replaced with the following:
The 2012 Building Energy Efficiency Standard (BEES), being comprised of the 2012
IECC with Alaska-Specific Amendments, is the AHFC energy standard for all residential
construction projects.

. Chapter 12, Mechanical Administration, is deleted.

. M1301.2, Identification, is replaced with the following:

Each length of uncut pipe and tubing, and each pipe fitting utilized in a mechanical system
shall bear the identification of the manufacturer.

. M1501.1, Outdoor discharge, is amended to delete the exception.
. M1502.4.2, Duct installation, is amended as follows:
In the first sentence, replace '12' with '10' to conform with section R1604.1.3 Support.

Remove from the end of the third sentence “...and shall be mechanically fastened...” and
replace it with “...except where in conflict with the requirements of M1502.”

Replace the last sentence with the following:

Dryer exhaust ducts shall not be joined with screws or similar fasteners that protrude into the
duct.

93 of 96



PLANNING COMMISSION REGULAR MEETING
MAY 9, 2017

. M1506.2, Exhaust openings, is amended as follows:
Add to the end of the first sentence:
...and 3 feet (914 mm) horizontally from the air intake.

Add the exception:

Exhaust and intake openings that are part of a system engineered to prevent entrainment of
exhaust air are exempt; the exemption applies only to the exhaust and intake that is part of the
engineered system only, adjacent exhaust and inlet openings are not exempt.

Add the exception:

A ventilation system’s supply and exhaust vents on the exterior of a building may be separated
less than 10 feet as long as they are separated a minimum of 6 feet horizontally. (to conform
with Alaska-specific amendments to ANSI/ASHRAE 62.2-2010)

. M1507, Mechanical ventilation is replaced with the following:

Mechanical Ventilation shall be installed per the requirements of ANSI/ASHRAE 62.2-2010
as amended in R403.5 of the 2012 Building Energy Efficiency Standard and per manufacturer
requirements.

. M1602.1, Return air, is amended to add to the end of the second sentence:

only if an exhaust fan is installed with automated control such that a positive pressure is not
exerted on the structure while the furnace supply air handler is operating. Supply only systems
and/or systems designed to induce a positive pressure inside the dwelling with reference to the
outdoors are not permitted in Alaska.

AA. M1602.2, Prohibited sources, is amended to add to the end of 1:

...and at least 3' horizontally from the air intake.

Chapter 23, Solar Energy Systems, is replaced with the following:
Per AS 18.60.705 (a)(3): the 1997 edition of the Uniform Solar Energy Code published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials and adopted at the 67th
annual conference, September 1996, excluding pages 1-7 of Part I, Administration.

(G2412.9, Identification, is replaced with the following:

Each uncut length of pipe and tubing and each pipe fitting, utilized in a fuel gas system, shall
bear the identification of the manufacturer.

DD. Chapters 25-43 are deleted.

94 of 96



96 40 G6

2017

MAY

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday
01 02 03 04 05 06
6:00 PM - City Council Work 7:00 PM - Fisheries Development
Session Committee
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B) (Cordova Center Rooms A & B)
7:00 PM - City Council Regular
Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B)
07 08 09 10 11 12 13
6:30 PM - Planning Commission 7:00 PM - Harbor Commission
Public Hearing Regular Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B) (Cordova Center Room B)
6:45 PM - Planning Commission 7:00 PM - School Board Regular
Regular Meeting Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B) (High School Library)
14 15 16 17 18 19 20
7:00 PM - City Council Regular
Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B)
21 22 23 24 25 26 27
7:00 PM - CCMC Board Regular
Meeting
(CCMC Conference Room)
28 29 30 31

City Closed - Memorial Day

6:00 PM - Parks and Recreation
Commission Regular Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B)

LTOZ ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dV1NDO3TH NOISSININOD DNINNV1d



96 10 96

2017 JUNE

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday
01 02 03
04 05 06 07 08 09 10
7:00 PM - City Council Regular
Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B)
11 12 13 14 15 16 17
6:30 PM - Planning Commission 7:00 PM - Harbor Commission
Regular Meeting Regular Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B) (Cordova Center Room B)
7:00 PM - School Board Regular
Meeting
(High School Library)
18 19 20 21 22 23 24
7:00 PM - City Council Regular 7:00 PM - CCMC Board Regular
Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B) (CCMC Conference Room)
25 26 27 28 29 30

6:00 PM - Parks and Recreation
Commission Regular Meeting
(Cordova Center Rooms A & B)

LTOZ ‘6 AVIN
ONILITN dV1NDO3TH NOISSININOD DNINNV1d



	05-09-17 Agenda_0
	04-11-17 Regular Meeting Minutes_0
	1066_001
	1117_001
	LetterofConcern_0
	05_09_2017_Planners Report_0
	MemoRJVariance_0
	1Variance App
	2Drawings
	3Drawings
	4Drawings
	5Drawings
	Memo - OceanBeauty Site Plan Review_0
	OBSI application
	OBSI A SHEETS pack
	OBSI C SHEETS pack
	OBSI D SHEETS pack
	Memo recommendationCCLot8_9_9_0
	RFP Lots 8&9 Odiak
	1195_001
	1196_001
	samMemo - IRC Amendments_0
	RewriteCH16Final_0
	May Calendar
	June Calendar

